Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: household food waste.
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I am writing to request the following information regarding household food waste collected during the summer months:

Q1. The total weight (in tonnes) of household food waste collected in June, July, and August for each of the past three years (2022, 2023, and 2024 if available). Please break this down by month and year.


Answer:

The Council does not hold this information. We do not record the data requested as food waste is not yet collected separately in Leicester.
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

Q2. Does your council collect food waste separately from general waste, or is it collected alongside general waste? If the approach has changed over the three-year period, please indicate the relevant collection method by year.

Food waste is not separated in Leicester at this time and is collected with the residual waste in the black bin. 
There have been no changes to this collection method over the last three years.

Q3. Have any internal records, reports, or campaigns noted a seasonal increase in food waste during the summer months, or highlighted barbecues as a contributing factor?

Not applicable


Q4. If recorded, can you provide a breakdown of the most commonly discarded food types during the summer months (e.g. meat, salad, bread, other perishables)?
Not applicable
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
