FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Timeframe requested: 1 April 2023 to the present.

Request:
1. For properties in your billing area that received Empty Property Relief (EPR) during the timeframe, how many involved a period of re-occupation prior to the EPR being (re)applied where the occupying use was installation and/or operation of a Battery Energy Storage System (BESS)?

· If you do not hold this as a coded field, please confirm "information not held".
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. If held, please provide for those cases:

· a) Count of properties;

· b) The length of the qualifying occupation period recorded (weeks);

· c) Any internal category/notes used to describe the occupying use (e.g., "battery storage," "plant room," "energy equipment");

· d) Whether any VOA checks/alterations were made (Y/N).
Not applicable. 

3. Please provide any local guidance or policy issued to officers since 1 April 2024 about the 13-week re-occupation rule before EPR can be granted again (or a link if published).
This is a statutory change, therefore, there is no local guidance or policy issued to officers. This is applied as stated in regulations.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
