Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act to request the following information:
1. How many allotment plots are available ?
There are 3177 allotment plots within the city (based within allotment society sites and city council-managed sites). Currently there are  106 plots available but these include what are known as “void plots” which are plots that cannot be cultivated for e.g. flooding, heavy clay soil.

2. What is an average size of an allotment?
The average site of an allotment is 250 square metres – approximately the size of a doubles tennis court – although some sites offer half -size plots

3. How many people are on the waiting list?
As of September 2021, there were 1037 applicants who had expressed an interest in an allotment plot (either at an allotment society or council-managed site). 

4. What is the average waiting time?
12 months across all sites.

5. What is the average age of the allotment owner?
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
