Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Tiny Home and Eco Home Building Permissions
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. The total number of applications made for the construction of tiny homes, eco homes, or homes built from shipping containers in the UK over the last 12 months, 3 years, and 5 years, respectively.

2. A breakdown of the number of applications mentioned above by year, specifying the number of applications for each of the last 12 months, 3 years, and 5 years.

3. The number of applications that were approved for the construction of tiny homes, eco homes, or homes built from shipping containers over the last 12 months, 3 years, and 5 years, respectively.


4. A breakdown of the number of approvals mentioned above by year, specifying the number of approvals for each of the last 12 months, 3 years, and 5 years.

5. The number of applications that were rejected for the construction of tiny homes, eco homes, or homes built from shipping containers over the last 12 months, 3 years, and 5 years, respectively.

6. A breakdown of the number of rejections mentioned above by year, specifying the number of rejections for each of the last 12 months, 3 years, and 5 years.

7. Information on the geographic distribution of these applications and approvals, including details on the regions or local authorities where they were filed and granted.

For Qs 1-7, as the description of planning applications would not necessarily contain the format of ‘tiny homes’ nor the descriptors of eco-homes nor shipping containers this information cannot be extracted from the planning database within the appropriate time limits for FOI (Section 12 – over the appropriate limit) and EIR (Reg 12 (4) (b) manifestly unreasonable). This is therefore a refusal notice.
The information which is held is publicly available and can however be found using the advanced search function on the Council’s Planning portal at Find and comment on planning applications (leicester.gov.uk). 

8. Any specific policies, guidelines, or criteria that local authorities use to evaluate applications for tiny homes, eco homes, or homes built from shipping containers.

The Council’s planning policies are publicly available at Adopted planning policy (leicester.gov.uk).  As such this information is exempt in accordance with Section 21 of the FOIA and Regulation 6 (1) (b) of the EIR, the information is publicly-accessible to applicants. 


9. Any available data or insights regarding the reasons for rejections of these applications.

See response to Q1-7.

10. Information on any trends or changes in the number of applications, approvals, or rejections for such housing types over the specified time periods.
11. Any other relevant information or insights that may assist in understanding the process and success rates of obtaining permissions for these housing types.

For Q10-11, the Council does not hold any ‘analysis of trends’ and ‘insights’ associated with this information.  The Council is informing you as required by Section 1 (1) of the FOIA and Regulation 12 (4) (a) of the EIR, information not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
