FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 

Detail of which schools currently maintained by the Local Authority hold or are included within contracts with Aspens Services Ltd. 

The start and end dates of any such contract, with preference to seeing a copy of the contract itself. 

Any TUPE paperwork that was shared with staff regarding any transfer into or out of Aspens in all applicable schools. 
This information is not held by Leicester City Council.  The contractual arrangement is one between each individual school and the provider. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

Please contact the individual schools directly. The link below will take you to a list of schools within the Authority:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/education-lifelong-learning/about-schools/schools-directory/schools-directory/  School ward, head teacher, telephone, e mail etc. is available by clicking on the link for each school.

Details of the number of transferees involved in any of the above referenced TUPE transfers. 
	School
	FTE
	Headcount

	Alderman Richard Hallam Primary School
	2.84
	6

	Avenue Primary School
	0.64
	2

	Barley Croft Primary School
	1.61
	3

	Caldecote Community Primary School
	2.07
	4

	Catherine Infant School
	2.03
	4

	Catherine Junior School
	1.93
	4

	Coleman Primary School
	0.87
	3

	Dovelands Primary School
	1.86
	4

	Eyres Monsell Primary
	0.74
	1

	Eyres Monsell Primary School
	1.32
	3

	King Richard III Infant School
	1.41
	3

	Medway Community Primary School
	1.80
	5

	Rushey Mead Primary School
	1.89
	4

	Scraptoft Valley Primary School
	1.58
	3

	Wolsey House Primary School
	2.09
	4

	Wyvern Primary School
	1.94
	4



The number of staff who are outsourced to Aspens in each applicable school.

Again, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Please contact the schools directly.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
