FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the FOI Act 2000 I am requesting the following information:

1 . The number of Looked After Children (LAC) in your local authority who between the ages of 16-18 are living or did live in independent living placements. Please provide the numbers of LACs living in independent living placements broken down by year from 2014 to the most recent statistics possible, ideally present day. If records as far back as 2014 are not kept, please provide records from the earliest date you have them until the most recent statistics available.

The Council holds some of the information you have asked for.

	
	P2

	2022
	46

	2023
	17

	2024
	5


Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

Prior to 2022, this information was not recorded in a reportable format, the data would have been recorded in the young person’s case file. Therefore, staff would be required to trawl through the case files of every young person in care for the time frame you’ve specified.  

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

2. The number of Looked After Children (LAC) in your local authority who between the ages of 16-18 are living or lived in semi-independent living placements. Please provide the numbers of LACs living in semi-independent living placements broken down by year from 2014 to the most recent statistics possible, ideally present day. If records as far back as 2014 are not kept, please provide records from the earliest date you have them until the most recent statistics available.

	
	H5/H5a

	2022
	34

	2023
	103

	2024
	26


As above for the data from 2014 onwards.
3. The number of independent living properties that the local authority have in their boundary and the number of them that are Ofsted approved.

Although we know a number of providers within Leicester City’s boundary, we do not know the number of individual properties owned.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4. The total number of 16-18 year olds in your local authority who are/were Looked After Children between 2014-present day. If records as far back as 2014 are not kept, please provide records from the earliest date you have them until the most recent statistics available.

	Date
	16-18 CLA

	31 March 2022
	119

	31 March 2023
	136

	31 March 2024
	162

	13 May 2024
	164


As above for the data from 2014 onwards.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
