Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: vehicle fleets and associated systems
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
These are all questions pertaining to Local Authority/ Public sector vehicle fleets and associated systems

1. Full fleet list with vehicle makes types and quantities?

Answer:

Please see attached file.
2. Any fleet replacement programmes planned for the next five years, with details of the manufacturer that will be used if already agreed.

Please see indicated replacement column in the attached file.  
The Council has no prior arrangements in place with suppliers.
3. Total number of vehicles with CCTV camera systems installed?

10

4. Who is the CCTV system provider

No specific system. Systems are provided by the supplier as the specification only states 4 camera CCTV system with recordable hard drive, most common system in use is Vision Techniques.

5. Total Number of vehicles with vehicle tracking / telematics installed?

666

6. Who is the Telematics system provider?

Questar is the system fitted. Current system is now out of contract, work is currently in progress evaluating tender submissions with a planned award later this year.


7. Contract budgets, length of contract, expiry date and annual spend, for telematics and camera systems?
This information is not held.  This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, the information requested is not held by Leicester City Council.

The new contract will be awarded for 2 years with the option to extend by 1 year.

8. Details of all safety-related incidents in the last five years?

This information is not available. Exemption section 1.1 of the Act -information not held apply. 
9. Do you currently operate waste services (collections) directly, or through a waste/recycling/street cleansing contractor such as Biffa, Suez or Veolia. If through a contractor, please name them (if relevant)?

Leicester City Council has a 25 year PFI contract with Biffa Leicester Limited for the collection and disposal of household waste. 

10. Which of the IT systems below do you use for the management of day-to-day municipal waste management/cleansing services (if relevant):
a. Yotta
b. Bartec Collective
c. Whitespace/Powersuite
d. Selected Interventions / Echo
e. Core (Suez)
f. Webaspx
g. Other: [please name]

g - Microsoft system


11. When is your current contract for the IT system OR outsourced waste contract for waste collections management due to expire (if relevant)?

The contract with Biffa Leicester Limited for the collection and disposal of household waste expires in May 2028. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

