FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
This request is regarding councils deeming that a person has partaken in a deliberate deprivation of assets. 

This is the process in which the council decides if someone has deliberately given away or disposed of some or all of their savings, other capital assets, or income, to reduce the amount of their assessed care and support charge. 

I would be keen to get answers and information for the following questions.

1) Could you please provide me with the total number of instances where your council has deemed that someone has carried out a ‘deliberate deprivation of assets’? Could you please break these down by year 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25, and 2025/26 so far?

2) Could you please provide me with the total amount in cash terms that people have had to pay towards care costs after being deemed to have partaken in a deliberate deprivation of assets? Could you please break these down by year 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25, and 2025/26 so far?

3) Could you please give me the number of times that the council has had to recover debts from a third party after finding that a ‘deliberate deprivation of assets' has taken place? Could you please break these down by year 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25, and 2025/26 so far?
In response to the above 3 questions.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not held in a format that is reportable for the purpose of this request.  To clarify, while we do investigate these types of cases, we do not hold any centrally recorded dataset showing how many such cases there have been or their outcomes. Each case is recorded within individual case files, not coded or categorised in a way that allows us to extract this information without a manual trawl.  Therefore, we estimate that locating, retrieving, and extracting this information would take significantly more than 18 hours of officer time and the request exceeds the appropriate limit of the Act.
4) Could you provide me with the number of times complaints have been raised with the Local Government and Social Care Ombudsman from people who have been accused by the council of carrying out a deliberate deprivation of assets? Could you provide me with the number of times the ombudsman has upheld the claimant's claim?
We’ve not had any complaints either directly, or subsequently from the LGO,  that relate to the deliberate deprivation of assets.
If it is not possible to provide the information requested due to the information exceeding the cost of compliance limits identified in Section 12, please provide advice and assistance under the Section 16 obligations of the Act, as to how I can refine my request.

We would suggest narrowing your time frame to a recent month and reducing the case data you require.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
