FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I wish to enquire about the processes used to allocate Blue Badges for disabled people in the years 2018 and 2024.

I am interested in the distribution of badges across age and gender, specifically for drivers and passengers who have difficulty with walking or an inability to walk. 

I would be most grateful if you could answer the following questions and provide the information indicated in the tables below for each of the years 2018 and 2024.

Questions

1) Were applications assessed “in house” or was the process outsourced?
Response: 
Blue Badges allocation applications for the years 2018 and 2024 were assessed in-house.

2) If outsourced, which organisation processed the applications?
Not applicable.
3) What was the estimated annual cost of processing Blue Badge applications?
2024
197,569.60

4) What was the estimated annual cost, in terms of lost income from council parking, of each Blue Badge issued?
Leicester City Council does not hold this information. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5) Was there a cap on the number of Blue Badges issued?
No
6) Were video submissions accepted as a means of demonstrating need?

No
A table illustrating full details of the information required is on the following page.

Should you require clarification please contact me 

Data Table

For each of the years 2018 and 2024 please supply the data separately for men and women who applied for a Blue Badge because of difficulty with walking or inability to walk in the following age categories. Data in Excel would be appreciated

WOMEN

Age Number applied Accepted without assessment Rejected without assessment Accepted following assessment Rejected following assessment Accepted following appeal Rejected following appeal

Under 16 

16 - 18 

19 - 29 

30 - 39 

40 - 49 

50 -59 

60 - 65 

65 - 69 

70 - 79 

80 - 89 

90+ 

MEN

Age Number applied Accepted without assessment Rejected without assessment Accepted following assessment Rejected following assessment Accepted following appeal Rejected following appeal

Under 16 

16 – 18 

19 - 29 

30 - 39 

40 - 49 

50 -59 

60 - 65 

65 - 69 

70 - 79 

80 - 89 

90+

With regards to the data table required we have determined that the scope of your request would exceed the appropriate time limit set out, as the cost and time it would take would exceed 18 hours to retrieve. Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific about what information you particularly wish to obtain, including any dates or period of time relevant to the information required. We do have a duty to advise and assist you in refining your request under s16 of the Act so please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in refining your request.

However, under our duty to provide advice and assistance we can confirm that a total of 12,251 badges were issued across 2018 and 2024 combined. To determine the basis on which each case was issued, the eligibility criteria applied, and whether a reassessment is required, it would be necessary to undertake a comprehensive review of each individual application. This process would involve examining the original documentation, verifying the eligibility decisions made at the time of issue. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.


If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk

Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
