Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Right to Buy property valuations
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please provide details of all Right to Buy (RTB) property valuations in the LE4 postcode area for the calendar years 2024 and 2025 (to date). Specifically, I would like the following information for each property:

1. Date of valuation
2. Type of property (e.g. house, flat, maisonette)
3. postcode
4. Number of bedrooms
5. Initial valuation amount
6. Valuation after assessment by the District Valuer (if applicable)
7. Whether the property's valuation was later reduced by the council due to discovery of defects or other issues after the original valuation

If so, please include the reason for the reduction and the revised valuation figure
Answer:

We do not hold an available dataset containing the per-property valuation information you have requested. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Individual RTB valuation records form part of tenants’ application case files. Releasing them in the form you request (including postcode, property type, bedroom count and valuation figures) would identify individual households. This information is exempt from release under section 40(2) -personal data.

Where information is requested for disclosure to the wider world (which is how any disclosure made under the FOI Act must be considered) a consideration must be made as to whether this would breach Data Protection Principles.
If held this information can only be released if to do so would not contravene any of the principles set out in Article 5(1) of the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR)
.

Here, the Council judges that this personal data is being processed for the purpose of the Right to Buy scheme. Disclosure to the wider world would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified and not incompatible purposes. 

Where valuations are determined by the District Valuer (Valuation Office Agency), those reports are supplied to the Council under a duty of confidence. Disclosure would be a breach of that confidence, and so the information is also exempt under Section 41 of FOIA.

Information already published

We have previously published responses on Right to Buy which are relevant:

FOIA 30090 (Feb 2024): Request about RTB sales within 2 miles of LE4 0SF, including reference to District Valuer appeals.

FOIA 33747 (Dec 2024): Spreadsheet of RTB sales from January–December 2024, showing property type, postcode, and completion date.

FOIA 33382 (2024): Request about independent valuations by the District Valuer, provided in aggregate.

FOIA 34076 (Mar 2025): Request about RTB applications in 2024/25, provided in summary form.

These are available via our FOI Disclosure Log here: Leicester City Council - FOI Directory
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
