FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
This is a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. I would like to request the following information:

1. A list of executive cabinet members, including the city mayor, along with their total air miles accumulated from 1 January 2021 to 31 December 2024, organised by year.

A list of Counsellors and the City Mayor’s team can be found via the following links:

My team
Your Councillors
Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.

Information regarding air miles is not held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  

2. A list of senior management members and their total air miles accrued from January 2021 to December 2024, organised by year.

Again a list of all senior management can be found via the following link:

Senior Management Structure — Leicester Open Data
Information regarding air miles is not held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  

3. The overall cost of air travel incurred by both executive and senior management members.

	2021
	£0

	2022
	£0

	2023
	£730.96

	2024
	£0


4. A PDF document outlining the council's internal travel policy, guidelines, or related information for employees, including senior management and executive cabinet members (inc. city mayor) related to air travel.

We have an overseas travel policy for Members which can be found via the following link: Decision - Overseas visits and engagement policy (leicester.gov.uk)
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
