FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Q1. How many foster carers/families do you currently need in your Local Authority area?

We always need more foster carers who can meet the needs of our children.  We do not hold a specific figure.  This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
All foster carer enquiries are welcome at Leicester City Council Fostering or 0116 454 4500.

Q2. Of the carers identified in Q1, how many are needed to support children from the following groups:

●      Different ethnicities

●      Different faiths/religions

●      Children with disabilities

As above, we do not hold specific figures.  Carers are welcome from all ethnicities and religions, to meet a range of needs.  
For ease, we have provided a table below for completion. If you do not hold data in the exact format or categories requested, please provide it in the format available.

	Group
	Carers needed

	Ethnicity
	 

	White (including White British, Irish, Other White)
	 

	Mixed/Multiple ethnic groups
	 

	Asian/Asian British (Indian, Pakistani, Bangladeshi, Chinese, Other Asian)
	 

	Black/Black British (African, Caribbean, Other Black)
	 

	Other ethnic group (Arab, any other ethnic group)
	 

	Religion/Faith
	 

	Christian
	 

	Muslim
	 

	Hindu
	 

	Sikh
	 

	Jewish
	 

	Buddhist
	 

	Other religion
	 

	Disability
	 

	Children recorded as having a disability
	 


 

Q3. Please confirm the number of children and young people in foster care placements in your Local Authority area during the following years:

	Year
	Total aggregate number

	2024 (1 January to 31 December)
	 500 individuals (some multiple placements)

	2025 (1 January to 30 September)
	 444 individuals (some multiple placements)


 

Q4. Please confirm the number of children in foster care placements within your Local Authority for the years 2024 (to 31 December) and 2025 (to 30 September) broken down by:
●      Ethnicity

●      Religion/faith

●      Disability status

For ease, we have provided a table below for completion. If you do not hold data in the exact format or categories requested, please provide it in the format available.

	Group
	2024 (1 Jan to 31 Dec)
	2025 (1 Jan to 30 Sept)

	Ethnicity
	
	

	White (including White British, Irish, Other White)
	309
	259

	Mixed/Multiple ethnic groups
	97
	94

	Asian/Asian British (Indian, Pakistani, Bangladeshi, Chinese, Other Asian)
	46
	47

	Black/Black British (African, Caribbean, Other Black)
	32
	23

	Other ethnic group (Arab, any other ethnic group)
	10
	10

	Not stated / unknown
	6
	11

	Religion/Faith
	
	

	Christian
	65
	47

	Muslim
	53
	59

	Hindu
	7
	6

	Sikh
	10
	9

	Jewish
	
	

	Buddhist
	
	

	Other religion
	19
	13

	No religion
	193
	163

	Not stated / unknown
	153
	147

	Disability
	
	

	Children recorded as having a disability
	45
	36

	Children recorded as not having a disability
	413
	361

	Not stated / unknown
	42
	47


 

Q5 How many of your current foster carers are in each of the following age brackets?

· 25-29 = 5

· 30-34 = 4

· 35-39 = 11

· 40-44 = 25

· 45-49 = 22

· 50-54 = 23

· 55-59 = 24

· 60-64 = 27

· 65 + = 24

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
