Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: pedestrian falls
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I would be very grateful if you could answer the following questions for the years 2022, 2023 and 2024 in your local authority area:

1. 
How many pedestrian falls occurred on public highways (with any kind of surface) in your council area (includes roads, footways, pedestrian areas, car parks etc)?
Answer:

We do not hold this information. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. 
How many complaints about poor surface conditions (for footways) have been received?
2022/23 - 569
2023/24 - 588
2024/25 - 625

 
3. 
How many kilometres of footways in your LA area are surfaced?
1,411.3 km

4. 
How many pedestrian falls occurred on public highways in your council area (includes roads, footways, pedestrian areas, car parks etc) on asphalt?
We do not hold this information.
5. 
How many km of footways in your LA area are surfaced in asphalt?
The following table is information we hold in relation q5, q7 & q9. The data is recently collated and has not been verified for accuracy.
	PMS Footway Lengths - Conversions

	Type
	length (m)
	length (km)
	length (M)

	Bituminous
	927462.00
	927.46
	576.30

	Setts
	763.00
	0.76
	0.47

	Concrete
	3610.00
	3.61
	2.24

	Concrete (Flag)
	49201.00
	49.20
	30.57

	Modular
	430265.00
	430.27
	267.35

	Total
	1411301.00
	1411.30
	876.94


6.
 How many pedestrian falls occurred on public highways in your council area (includes roads, footways, pedestrian areas, car parks etc) on brick/stone paving?
We do not hold this information.

7. 
How many km of footways in your LA area are surfaced in brick/stone?
See Q.5


8. 
How many pedestrian falls occurred on public highways in your council area (includes roads, footways, pedestrian areas, car parks etc) on concrete?
We do not hold this information.

9. 
How many km of footways in your LA area are surfaced in concrete?
See Q.5
10. What was the Total number of claims for compensation received each year?

2022/23 - 65

2023/24 - 49

2024/25 - 68


11. 
What was the Total claims paid out (£), each year? 
Should read more correctly as: How many successful claims were paid out to pedestrians who fell on public highways, footpaths, etc, during the specified year?

This is normally a whole number, which each successful claim being aligned to a single pedestrian. A successful claim is defined from the perspective of the person who has fallen and is making the claim (for damages or injuries or inconvenience, etc, from a fall attributed to a surface). The final outcome of funds being transferred to the individual making the claim. Normally this number is smaller than the total number of claims received for the same period. 
2022/23 - 7

2023/24 - 4

2024/25 - 2


12. 
What was the Total compensation paid (£), each year?
Should read more correctly as: How much total money was paid out in successful claims for the period specified (UK pound sterling for the year, with year normally defined at January 1st to December 31st)? In other words the sum total of all claims paid out. 

2022/23 - £40,000

2023/24 - £19,000

2024/25 - £Nil


13. 
What was the Highest amount paid for single claim (£), each year?
2022/23 - £15,000

2023/24 - £5,500

2024/25 - £Nil


14. 
What was the Lowest amount paid for single claim (£), each year?
2022/23 - £2,800

2023/24 - £4,100

2024/25 - Nil


15. 
Has/is your local authority considered/considering using impact absorbing (soft) surface paving for footways? No or Yes 

No

16. 
(IF YES) Does your local authority have a contact name for the team using these surfaces?

N/A

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
