FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am sending this request under the Freedom of Information Act to ask for the following information.     

1.How many employees have complained to Leicester City Council that they had faced racism or racial discrimination at work in the following years: Jan-Dec 2015, Jan-Dec 2016, Jan-Dec 2017, Jan-Dec 2018, Jan-Dec 2019, Jan-Dec 2020, Jan-Dec 2021, Jan-Dec 2022, Jan-Dec 2023, Jan-Dec 2024 and Jan-25 July 2025. Please tabulate in the corresponding years. 
2.In these years, how many complaints did the council investigate and uphold? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.
In response to questions 1 and 2, information regarding recorded complaints is held from 2017 onwards.  We do not hold data prior to this date regarding the numbers investigated/upheld. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
	Number of complaints investigated with outcomes 

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Number of complaints
	3
	0
	2
	2
	1
	2
	2
	0
	3

	Upheld
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0

	Not upheld
	3
	0
	2
	2
	1
	2
	2
	0
	0

	Ongoing 
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1

	Withdrawn
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	2


3.In these years, how many complaints did the council reject which then went to employment tribunal? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.
Below is a record of the number of employment tribunal cases, this data is held from 2015 onwards.
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	1
	0
	3
	1
	2
	0
	4
	3
	0
	2
	1


The information in the table provides the number of claims which have included an allegation of race discrimination or racial harassment that have been presented by centrally employed individuals against the Council
4.In these years, of these how many cases did the council lose? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	0
	0


The data provided shows the result of the claim against the year in which the claim was issued (where an outcome has been reached). The outcome may, however, have been given in a different year.

5.In these years, of these how many cases did the council appeal to the Employment Appeals Tribunal [EAT]? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	0
	0


6.In these years, of these how many cases did the council take to the Court of Appeal? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	0
	0


7.In these years, of these how many cases did the council appeal further? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0


8.In Qs 3-7 inclusive, how much did the council spend on legal costs? Please tabulate in the corresponding years.

In relation to Q3-4. The majority of the claims involved multiple claims, and it is not possible to separate the costs associated with the race discrimination allegations.  We therefore do not hold the information relating to costs specifically associated with claims of race discrimination.  This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
In response to Q5-7.  The case has not concluded, therefore, disclosure of the amount spent to date would compromise the Council’s litigation strategy. Releasing the sums of money spent on any individual case could impact upon the future conduct of those proceedings and result in rising costs to the Council.  The Council considers there is a strong public interest in avoiding likely prejudice, and, consequently, that withholding the figures outweighs the public interest in providing the costs.

Therefore, this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 31 of the Act is being applied – Law Enforcement.

Section 31(1)(c) – Law Enforcement 

1) Information which is not exempt information by virtue of section 30 is exempt information if its disclosure under this Act would, or would be likely to, prejudice –

c) The administration of justice 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
