FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

Please can all of the following questions be broken down by academic year from 2014/15 to today. 
1. Of those appeals submitted against education, health and care plans, please can I have a breakdown of how many were pupil premium (PP) eligible vs non pupil premium eligible. 

2. Of those appeals submitted against education, health and care plans that continued to a tribunal, please can I have a breakdown of how many were pupil premium eligible vs non pupil premium eligible re the children involved. Please can this be broken down by academic year from 2014/15 to today. 

3. Of the tribunal hearings that were in the parents' / appellant's favour, how many were PP vs non-PP of the children involved?

4. Of the tribunal hearings that were in the council's favour, how many were PP vs non PP re the children involved?

5. Of any other outcomes (please state the outcome) how many were PP vs non PP?

Please see attached spreadsheet. They are all appeals. We have highlighted the ones that went to Tribunal.
Appeal conceded – we have conceded before it goes to tribunal

Appeal withdrawn – parents withdrew appeal

Appeal decided in favour of – Tribunal made decision at hearing

Lost – parent ‘won’ their appeal

Won – parent ‘lost’ their appeal

Concluded by consent – LA and parent agreed changes and parent withdrew appeal before tribunal hearing date

ORDER – decision made at Tribunal hearing

Struck out by Judge – decision made before tribunal hearing by judge

Resolved – agreed with parent before Tribunal hearing – same as concluded by consent

Ongoing – not concluded yet

Please note that information on PP was not recorded in 2019 and 2020 and therefore this is information not held under the Act.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
