Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
re: council owned property
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

Please provide me with the following information concerning the council owned property at number 285 Gooding Avenue, Braunstone:

1) On what date did the previous tenants tenancy agreement officially end..?

2) During the previous tenants tenancy, did the Leicester city council serve any form of notice to the tenant for having an untidy property or gardens..? If yes, how many notices have been served..? and on what dates..?

3) Please provide me with a copy off all reports and any other correspondence between all council officers regarding the property and gardens from when the previous tenants tenancy agreement officially ended to the 12/05/2022..

Answer:

In respect of Qs 1 - 3, the Council can confirm that this information is held, however, the information is exempt from release as the Council considers that to be an absolute exemption under Section 40(2) (personal data), and this therefore constitutes a refusal under Section 17 of the Act. 

The Council judges that the information relates to a third party (the previous tenant) and that disclosure of this information to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified, legitimate & explicit purposes. 


4) What is the estimated cost to clear the property..?

5) What is the estimated cost to clear the front and rear gardens..?

The Council does not cost properties individually, therefore the information with regards to Qs 4 & 5 is not held.  This is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by the Council.

6) On what date(s) will clearance works inside the property commence..? 

7) On what date(s) will clearance works to the front and rear gardens commence..? 

With regard to Qs 6 & 7, the information is not held.  The Council has not set a date for this works due to property structural issues.
8) what date did the Leicester City Council last visit the property..?

28 April 2022 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
