Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Social Care Finance and Commissioning Services
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

Please can you provide the name, direct telephone number and email address for the following senior management positions responsible for Social Care Finance and Commissioning Services:
 

1. Head of Finance for Children’s Services: This would be the individual responsible for the financial management of Children’s Services.

Answer:

Martin Judson - Head of Finance, Martin.Judson@leicester.gov.uk 0116 4544101
2. Head of Finance for Adult Services: This would be the individual responsible for the financial management of Adult Services.

As above
 
3. Head of School Finance: This would be the individual with ultimate responsibility for ensuring School funding, budgets, formulae and capital funding projects.

The Council does not hold this information, schools manage their own budgets.
This is therefore a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.
Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to the Schools’ Directory page:  

https://schoolinfo.leicester.gov.uk/DirectorySearch.html
4. Head of Commissioning for Children’s Services: This would be the individual responsible for the day-to-day running of the Commissioning Department for Children’s Services.

Kate Galoppi - Director Adult Social Care & Commissioning, Kate.Galoppi@leicester.gov.uk 0116 4542371

 

5. Head of Commissioning for Adult Services: This would be the individual responsible for the day-to-day running of the Commissioning Department for Adult Services.

As above in 4
 
6. Head of Commissioning for Special Educational Needs: This would be the individual responsible for SEN and/or SEND Commissioning.

Tracie Rees - Director of SEND & Early Help, Tracie.Rees@leicester.gov.uk 0116 4542301

 
Please can you also provide the name, direct telephone number and email address for the following senior management positions responsible for Social Care Performance Management and ICT

1. Adult Finance Manager. This would be the individual who reports directly into the Head of Adult Finance.

 
2. Children’s Finance Manager. This would be the individual who reports directly into the Head of Children’s Finance.

 
3. Schools Finance Manager. This would be the individual who reports directly into the Head of schools Finance.

 
4. Adult Commissioning Manager. This would be the individual who reports directly into the Head of Adults Commissioning.

 
5. Children’s Commissioning Manager. This would be the individual who reports directly into the Head of Children’s Commissioning.

With regard to Qs.1, 2, 4 & 5 above, the Council is withholding this information because disclosure of personal data relating to junior members of staff below Heads of Service are exempt from release as the Council considers that to be an absolute exemption under Section 40(2) (personal data.
The Council judges that disclosure of this information to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified, legitimate & explicit purposes. 
In respect of Q3, the information is not held by the Council.
Finally, please can you confirm the name and/or make of the following Finance System

 

1. The name and/or make of your Adult Finance System. This could be: Mosaic Financials, ContrOCC, Agresso.

ContrOCC

2. The name and/or make of your Children’s Case Management System. This could be: Mosaic Financials, ContrOCC, Agresso.

Liquid Logic
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
