FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Please can you let me know how many businesses in your borough applied for the The Additional Restrictions Grant
This information is not held – unsuccessful applications were not recorded. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. How many were given approval to receive the fund
3,400

3. The total amount of funds allocated
£12,512,085

4. The total amount of funds still held by your council and yet to be given out
£57,000

5. The average waiting time to receive the full funds
Waiting times depended upon the particular strand of the ARG scheme to which businesses could apply and/or were eligible. Where an application was required, payments were generally made within two weeks.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
