FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
This request relates to your authority’s marketing, communications and engagement activity, including associated staffing, budgets, spend and functions. I am seeking this information to better understand how local authorities resource and deliver communications, engagement and consultation activity.


For the most recent full financial year for which data is available, please provide the following:


1. Organisational structure and staffing
a) The total number of employees (FTE) working wholly or primarily in marketing, communications, media, public relations, engagement, consultation or related functions.
b) The directorate, department or service area in which these staff sit.
c) A breakdown of roles or grades where available (e.g. senior leadership, managers, officers).  
	Service
	Team
	Job Title2
	Headcount
	FTE 

	Communications and Digital Engagement Service
	Communications & Digital Media
	Management
	1
	1.00

	
	
	Officers
	3
	2.68

	
	Communications & Marketing
	Support
	1
	1.00

	
	
	Management
	2
	1.60

	
	
	Officers
	16
	15.11

	
	Management
	Management
	1
	1.00



2. Budget and expenditure
a) The total annual budget allocated to marketing, communications and engagement activities.
£1,905,900.00


b) The total actual spend for the year.
£1,388,835.96


c) A breakdown of spend between:

· Staff costs (including salaries, on-costs and temporary staff or contractors) - broken down by post
	
	

	Post titles
	(£)

	Communications and Marketing Officer
	                                   404,212 

	Creative & Media Buyer
	                                     41,720 

	Graphic Designer
	                                     55,955 

	Media & PR Manager
	                                     68,745 

	Operations Manager (Print; Design and Distribution)
	                                     33,358 

	Photographer
	                                     38,365 

	PR & Media Officer
	                                   147,803 

	Sales Officer
	                                     37,494 

	Senior Communications & Marketing Officer
	                                   134,559 

	Grand Total
	                                   962,210 


· External suppliers or agencies

£426,625.85 breakdown as follows:
· Advertising and media spend

£10,664.00
· Website development


£84,552.23 
· Graphic and digital design

£21,012.77
· Print expenditure 



£310,396.85
· Events, consultation exercises and engagement programmes
Not applicable.
· Any other significant categories of spend  None, all covered above.
3. Core activities

Please outline the core activities undertaken by the marketing, communications and engagement function(s), for example:

· Corporate communications and media relations

· Campaigns and public information

· Internal communications

· Digital and social media

· Web content management and development

· Advertising/recruitment advertising/public notices

· Public consultation and engagement

· Community engagement

· Stakeholder or partner communications

· Behaviour change activities

All the above. 
4. Discretionary vs non-discretionary activity
Please indicate:
a) Which marketing, communications and engagement activities are considered essential or statutory (including any required by legislation or regulation).

Activities would include but not limited to:

· Certain consultations

· Essential public information e.g. council tax, elections, financial position statements, 

· Public notices

· Service updates and/or fees charges changes

b) Which activities are considered discretionary or non-essential.

Activities would include but not limited to:

· Email marketing

· Surveys and feedback/evaluation requests

· Brand or campaign activities

· Events

· Open days

c) Any distinction you make between internal, external and community-based engagement.

Key distinctions include:

· Internal is focused on staff and elected members and would include all staff emails, webinars and feedback surveys

· External is focussed on stakeholders and partners e.g. government and funding bodies, other local authorities, local partners including health and police, activities would include meetings, briefing papers, events and conferences 

· Community based activity is focused on groups such as local residents, community and faith groups, voluntary Sector organisations and activities would include public meetings,  co-design, focus groups and other research, methods 

5. Consultation and engagement spend
Please confirm:
a) Total spend on consultation and engagement activities (internal and external).

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not held centrally in a single reportable format. These costs are incurred across all teams.  As such, each service area/budget holder would need to trawl through all projects/engagement activities etc. to establish if relevant and then collate the spend.  

b) How this spend is categorised or recorded within your authority (e.g. as part of communications, policy, regeneration, public health or other budgets).

As above, expenditure is recorded against the individual teams within which engagement and consultation is taking place.  To gather the relevant information would exceed the prescribed limit of the Act.  If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.
If any of the information requested is not held centrally, please provide what is available and indicate where data is not held or not recorded in the format requested.


If responding to the full request would exceed the appropriate cost limit, I would be grateful if you could advise which elements could be provided within the limit, in line with your duty to provide advice and assistance under section 16 of the Act.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
