FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please could you respond to the following questions:

1. How many reports of fly tipping did the council receive on public land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?

2. How many reports of fly tipping did the council receive on private land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?

	Year
	Total (Public land)
	Total (Private land)

	2020
	8,390
	4

	2021
	7,314
	17

	2022
	6,245
	5

	2023
	6,422
	5

	2024
	6,560
	14

	2025 (to date)
	4,938
	8


3. How many people did the council prosecute for fly tipping on public land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?

4. How many people did the council prosecute for fly tipping on private land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?
Section 12 of the FOI Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for Local Authorities is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending 2.5 working days in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

Fly-tipping is an offence under S33 of the EPA and relates to waste on land that is not licensed by the environment agency to accept waste, therefore, all land that isn’t a waste disposal site.  

When fly-tipping is reported we ask if its on private land or public land,  this information is used to establish if the Council are responsible for clearing the waste. Where the waste is on private land, we pursue this separately as untidy land, not necessarily as a fly-tip.  We would need to ascertain if the landowner had left the waste or if another party was responsible.  Therefore, we do not specifically record prosecutions or fines by land ownership.  Staff would have to trawl through all case files/FPN files etc. to establish if a private land owner was responsible and was prosecuted/fined etc. Therefore, we estimate that locating, retrieving, and extracting this information would take significantly more than 18 hours of officer time and the request exceeds the appropriate limit of the Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us
The following figures relate to all prosecutions.
2020 to 2021 - 4

2021 to 2022 - 8

2022 to 2023 - 5

2023 to 2024 - 4

2024 to 2025 - 5

2025 to date - 6

5. How many fines did the council give out for fly tipping on public land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?

6. How many fines did the council give out for fly tipping on private land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?
As above, the figures below relate to all FPN’s issued.  Please note, this information is held from 2021 onwards. 

	OFFENCE
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Fly Tipping
	86
	55
	69
	88
	78



7. What was the total amount in fines that the council handed out for fly tipping in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?
Again, this information is held from 2021 onwards.

	OFFENCE
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Fly Tipping
	£34,400.00
	£22,000.00
	£26,990.00
	£31,007.20
	£36,766.00



8. How much have private landowners had to pay to remove fly tipped rubbish on their land in 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 and up to November 2025?  

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
