Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: pupils with offensive weapons in schools
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

For the purposes of this request, the time frames to be considered are:

- For the school year 2018/2019

- For the school year 2019/2020

- For the school year 2020/2021

- For the school year 2021/2022

- For the school year 2022/2023 so far, up to and including the day of your response to this inquiry. 

1. Broken down by the above timeframes, how many times have pupils been found with offensive, or potentially offensive, weapons on school premises within your local authority area? This includes being in possession of an article with a blade or point, or corrosive substance. 
Answer:

The data provided in the attached file relates to records held by the LA on incidents of fixed term exclusions (terminology changed to suspensions from 2021/22) and permanent exclusions where the offence involved an offensive weapon.

2. Can you please provide a breakdown of the weapons found and the age of the child involved in each case? 
There is no breakdown of the type of weapon available as the Council do not collect these details.  The suspensions and permanent exclusions are split by primary / secondary school / special school.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. Please detail in each case, if the case was reported to police?

This information is not recorded by the LA and as such is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
