Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR)
re: 5G, 3G-6G, LED streetlights, safety and insurance
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

 

1. The locations of all 5G towers/masts/transmitters in Leicester City.

Answer:
Leicester City Council does not hold the requested information in relation to private land owners/landlords.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA and Regulation 14 of the EIR, because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of EIR, the information for all locations in the City is not held by the Council.

The information in the table below is on the land/leases owned by Leicester City Council:
	Site Address
	Start Date of Lease
	Equipment 

	0219 - Bonney Road Allotments, Leicester LE3 9BY
	19/03/2007
	Telecommunication mast and associated equipment

	0273 - Brailsford Industrial Park, Leicester, LE3 1HR
	26/11/2005
	Unlimited

	0575 - Gilroes Farm Estate, Groby Road, Leicester, 
LE3 9QJ
	01/09/1998
	Telecommunication mast and associated equipment

	0620 - 135-141 Granby Street, Leicester, LE1 6FS
	15/01/2009
	Telecom Mast

	0797 - Freemans Common Nature Reserve, Aylestone Road, Leicester, LE2 7SQ
	29/07/1997
	National Grid Wireless

	0575 - Gilroes Farm Estate, Groby Road, Leicester, 
LE3 9QJ
	1/11/1991
	Radio Telecom Mast

	0879 - Leicester Outdoor Pursuits Centre, Loughborough Road, Leicester, LE4 5PN 
	01/10/2005
	Telecom Mast

	0879 - Leicester Outdoors Pursuits Centre, Loughborough Road, Leicester, LE4 5PN 
	15/07/2000 
	Telecom Mast

	1650 - Western Park, Leicester, LE3 6HX
	30/03/2000 
	Redefusion Building Mast

	2203 - The Lancaster Academy, Knighton Lane East, Leicester, LE2 6FU
	31/01/1996 
	Provision and/or operation of electronic communications apparatus 

	3069 - Saffron Hill Cemetery, Stonesby Ave, Leicester LE2 6TY 
	30/06/2016
	Telecom Mast


2. The dates each of these 5G towers/masts/transmitters became active (switched on/radiating).

The Council does not hold the transmission start date, therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of EIR, the information for held.  

We have supplied the lease start date in the above table.
3. Planned or envisaged future installations of (including planning applications for) 5G and 6G towers/masts/transmitters in Leicester City.

This information is publicly available by using the advanced search facility on the Council’s online application system available at: 
Planning Register - Leicester City Council
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA and Regulation 14 of the EIR, because in accordance with Section 21 of FOIA and Regulation 6(1)(b) of EIR, the information is made publicly accessible i.e. the Council’s website.
We have attached lists of:

a) all the approved ‘prior approval’ applications for telecommunications development over the last 5 years (this time period chosen as the approvals must be implemented within 5 years of the decision date), 
b) all the approved full planning applications for telecommunications lattice masts/towers over the last 3 years (this time period chosen as planning approvals must be implemented within 3 years of the decision date), 
c) all the approved full planning applications for telecommunications monopoles over the last 3 years, 
d) approved full planning applications for telecommunications antennas over the last 3 years. Some of the applications are duplicated in the lists if the application was for e.g. “monopole with antennas”. 
e) ‘prior approval’ applications under consideration at present 
f) the one full application for telecommunications development under consideration at present is: 20221618; Hollybank Court, 193 London Road; Upgrade of existing rooftop telecommunications equipment to comprise of 7 antennas; 4.6m tall equipment tower; and ancillary equipment and g) refusals of new monopoles within the last 3 years

4. The evidence and standards Leicester City Council has used, and is using, in assessing health risks and environmental risks of the technologies subject to this FOI request. 

The National Planning Policy Framework 2021 is attached. The consideration that the Council gives to health grounds is set out in paragraphs 117b and 118 of that document. It can be added that for ‘prior approval’ applications these are made under the general permitted development order which is also attached and as per schedule 2 part 16 the only considerations in these applications are ‘siting’ and ‘appearance’. 
3. Details of financial income received (by Leicester City Council, or other authorities/entitities) from the owners/operators of the technology for these installations.

Please see the table in response to Q1.
A guide to the fees for planning applications in England is attached. ‘Communications’ applications cost £462 for processing of an application. 
4. Public Liability insurance, and Health and Safety insurance risk coverage for any negative health effects arising from 5G installations/radiation.

5. Public Liability insurance, and Health and Safety insurance risk coverage for any negative health effects arising from other radiation installations of 3G, 4G, 6G, and radiation/blue light LED streetlighting, as part of Leicester City Council's insurance policies.

With respect to Qs. 4 & 5, Leicester City Council has in place liability insurance to respond to claims due to any alleged breach of statutory duty and/or negligence where a party has suffered injury, loss or damage.  The existence of such policies does automatically entitle a party to compensation.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
