FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. The current total of your General Fund debt.
The Council’s total debt is now £165m. None of this is attributable to the General Fund.

2. The total interest payments on your General Fund debt paid in the financial year 2022/23.
No debt is attributable to the General Fund.

3. The total revenue you obtained from the sale of General Fund assets, including buildings and land, in the financial year 2022/23.
The accounts for 2022/23 are still being finalised, and therefore, this information is exempt as it is intended for future publication in line with S22 of the Act. This letter acts as S17 refusal notice in respect of this part of your request. When available, they will be published here:  Statement of accounts (leicester.gov.uk). Previous years’ accounts can also be found here.

4. The estimate (if any) you have on the number of new homes that have been built or are due to be built on the land and buildings that you sold from your General Fund assets in the financial year 2022/23.

It is unlikely that land sold in 2022/23 will have been developed yet, therefore, we do not hold this information. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
