Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: smoke nuisance
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding complaints about smoke nuisance within your local authority. Please could you provide the following data:
1. The number of complaints received about smoke nuisance in the last 10 years (please provide a year-by-year breakdown from 2015 to 2025.)
Answer:

This data is exempt from release as it is accessible elsewhere under section 21 of the FOI Act.  

The answers to these questions are available on open-data - Noise and Pollution Complaints — Leicester Open Data
2. If recorded, the identified source of the smoke nuisance complaints (e.g., wood burners, bonfires, barbecues, grills, industrial sources, agricultural activities, or other specified sources).
This information not recorded.  Exemption section 1.1 of the Act apply -information not held by the Council.
3. Any available data on enforcement actions or resolutions taken in response to these complaints.
Information not available, and the Council is informing you in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act.
4. Whether your local authority has issued any public guidance, restrictions, or policy changes related to smoke nuisances in recent years.
Leicester City was redeclared as a single smoke control area in 2018, please see:

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-environment/pollution-and-pests/pollution-control/smoke-control-area/
5. Has the local authority received any complaints specifically citing health concerns (e.g., respiratory issues, aggravation of asthma, or other medical conditions) due to smoke nuisance?
Yes on occasion, it is mentioned in the service request.

1.  If so, what was the cause of the smoke nuisance noted? (e.g., wood burners, bonfires, barbecues, grills, industrial sources, agricultural activities, or other specified sources).
Industrial sources mostly dyers and finishers

2. If it is not possible to provide the information requested, please provide details of any recorded data that falls within the scope of this request. 

N/A
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
