Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
Re: Honour-based abuse and forced marriage
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Request 1:

We are beginning to map the prevalence of honour-based-abuse and forced marriage in the UK over the last 3 years.  Our aim is to identify patterns and trends in local responses to honour-based-abuse by comparing local authority data with the data Karma Nirvana’s honour-based-abuse national helpline collates.  

Does your organisation’s Case Management and Recording system facilitate tagging case file’s where, 
· Forced marriage has been identified
Yes/No

Answer:

Yes

· FGM has been identified 


Yes/No

Yes

Please could you send me:

1. The number of initial assessments carried out for children because they were identified as at risk of or experienced forced marriage between 01.04.18 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.20 – 31.03.21.

Please could you provide the age and gender breakdown in the table below

	Forced Marriage - Children
	01.04.18 - 31.03.19
	01.04.19 - 31.03.20
	01.04.20 - 31.03.21

	0 > 10
	 
	 
	 

	11 > 15
	3
	
	

	16 > 17
	1
	
	5

	18 + 
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	

	Female
	3
	
	5

	Male
	1
	
	

	Transgender
	 
	 
	 

	Lesbian
	 
	 
	 

	Gay
	 
	 
	 

	Non-binary
	 
	 
	 

	Bisexual
	 
	 
	 

	Any Other Gender
	 
	 
	 


2. The number of initial assessments carried out for vulnerable adults because they were identified as at risk of or experienced forced marriage between 01.04.18 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.20 – 31.03.21.
The Council’s homeless case management system does not break down homeless applications by HBV (honour-based vulnerable), therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held.
Please could you provide the age and gender breakdown in the table below
	Forced Marriage - Adults
	01.04.18 - 31.03.19
	01.04.19 - 31.03.20
	01.04.20 - 31.03.21

	16 > 17
	 
	 
	 

	18 > 25
	 
	 
	 

	26 > 35
	 
	 
	 

	36 > 45
	 
	 
	 

	46 > 55
	 
	 
	 

	56 > 65
	 
	 
	 

	66 > 75
	 
	 
	 

	75 +
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 

	Female
	 
	 
	 

	Male
	 
	 
	 

	Transgender
	 
	 
	 

	Lesbian
	 
	 
	 

	Gay
	 
	 
	 

	Non-binary
	 
	 
	 

	Bisexual
	 
	 
	 

	Any Other Gender
	 
	 
	 


3. How many MARAC referrals have been received for victims at risk of/experienced forced marriage between 01.04.18 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.20 – 31.03.21?

The Council does not collate numbers of Multi-Agency Risk Assessment Conferences (MARAC) referrals – this is collated by the police.  Therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.
Please could you provide the age and gender breakdown in the table below

	Forced Marriage - MARAC
	01.04.18 - 31.03.19
	01.04.19 - 31.03.20
	01.04.20 - 31.03.21

	16 > 17
	 
	 
	 

	18 > 25
	 
	 
	 

	26 > 35
	 
	 
	 

	36 > 45
	 
	 
	 

	46 > 55
	 
	 
	 

	56 > 65
	 
	 
	 

	66 > 75
	 
	 
	 

	75 +
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 

	Female
	 
	 
	 

	Male
	 
	 
	 

	Transgender
	 
	 
	 

	Lesbian
	 
	 
	 

	Gay
	 
	 
	 

	Non-binary
	 
	 
	 

	Bisexual
	 
	 
	 

	Any Other Gender
	 
	 
	 


4. The number of initial assessments carried out for children because they were identified as at risk of or experienced FGM between 01.04.18 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.20 – 31.03.21.

Please could you provide the age and gender breakdown in the table below

	FGM - Children
	01.04.18 - 31.03.19
	01.04.19 - 31.03.20
	01.04.20 - 31.03.21

	0 > 10
	5
	14
	6

	11 > 15
	1
	4
	

	16 > 17
	1
	1
	

	18 + 
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	

	Female
	5
	17
	6

	Male
	2
	
	

	Transgender
	
	
	

	Lesbian
	
	
	

	Gay
	
	
	

	Non-binary
	
	
	

	Bisexual
	 
	 
	 

	Any Other Gender
	 
	 2 unborn
	 


	NOTES:

	· There are 2 unborn children where gender is not known

	· 0-10 age range includes unborn children

	


5. The number of initial assessments carried out for vulnerable adults because they were identified as at risk of or experienced FGM between 01.04.18 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.20 – 31.03.21.

Please could you provide the breakdown of age and gender in the table below?

	FGM - Adults
	01.04.18 - 31.03.19
	01.04.19 - 31.03.20
	01.04.20 - 31.03.21

	18 > 25
	 
	1
	 

	26 > 35
	 
	
	 

	36 > 45
	 
	
	 

	46 > 55
	 
	
	 

	56 > 65
	 
	
	 

	66 > 75
	 
	
	 

	75 +
	 
	
	 

	 
	 
	
	 

	Female
	 
	1
	 

	Male
	 
	 
	 

	Transgender
	 
	 
	 

	Lesbian
	 
	 
	 

	Gay
	 
	 
	 

	Non-binary
	 
	 
	 

	Bisexual
	 
	 
	 

	Any Other Gender
	 
	 
	 


6. How many MARAC referrals have been received for victims at risk of/experienced FGM between 01.04.18 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.20 – 31.03.21?

As in 3 above 

Please could you provide the age and gender breakdowns in the table below

	FGM - MARAC
	01.04.18 - 31.03.19
	01.04.19 - 31.03.20
	01.04.20 - 31.03.21

	16 > 17
	 
	 
	 

	18 > 25
	 
	 
	 

	26 > 35
	 
	 
	 

	36 > 45
	 
	 
	 

	46 > 55
	 
	 
	 

	56 > 65
	 
	 
	 

	66 > 75
	 
	 
	 

	75 +
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 

	Female
	 
	 
	 

	Male
	 
	 
	 

	Transgender
	 
	 
	 

	Lesbian
	 
	 
	 

	Gay
	 
	 
	 

	Non-binary
	 
	 
	 

	Bisexual
	 
	 
	 

	Any Other Gender
	 
	 
	 


Request 2:

Does your organisation’s Case Management and Recording system facilitate tagging case file’s where, 
· Honour based abuse has been identified
Yes/No




Yes

Please could send me:

1. The number of initial assessments carried out for children because they were identified as at risk of honour-based abuse?

	 
	honour-based abuse

	Age
	2018-19
	2019-20
	2020-21

	0-10
	1
	 
	 

	11-15
	3
	 
	1

	16-17
	2
	 
	 

	18+
	 
	 
	 

	Female
	4
	 
	1

	Male
	2
	 
	 

	Unborn
	 
	 
	 


2. The number of initial assessments carried out for vulnerable adults because they were identified as at risk of honour-based abuse?

As 2 in above request
3. How many MARAC referrals have been received for victims experiencing honour-based-abuse?

As 3 in above request
4. The number of assessments of entitlement to housing for people who are homeless or threatened with homelessness identified as experiencing honour-based-abuse?
As 2 in above request

5. How many domestic homicide reviews were undertaken during the following years?

The following figures are those reviews at the point of receiving Home Office approval for publication

2017

2
2018

0
2019

1
2020

2
6. For each year outlined above, how many of the domestic homicide reviews related to victims impacted by Honour Based Abuse? Of these, how many victims were female? How many were male? How many were under the age of 18?

There was no record of honour based abuse in the domestic homicide reviews outlined in Q11. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

7. Honour Based Abuse Training and Awareness

8. Is training provided to staff about honour based abuse?
In respect of Qs 7 and 8, there is a specific, free to access, multi-agency partnership training programme in Leicester specific to domestic abuse and sexual violence and this includes honour based abuse.

9. If training is delivered, which staff receive or are eligible to receive this training? Is training compulsory and how is attendance / completion measured? 
Safeguarding training for adults and children is compulsory and monitored at team, divisional and corporate level.  
The broader domestic and sexual violence training is not compulsory across all council departments; it is up to specific services to determine their workforce needs.  All staff are eligible to book on the domestic and sexual violence training programme with the support of their line manager.

10. What format does this training take place (i.e. e-learning, face to face? How long does this training take to complete? How frequently is the training completed?

Online and face to face

11. If training is provided, pleased provide a copy of the course objectives

In the 2021-22 domestic and sexual violence multi-agency training programme, which the City Council compiles, there is a course on ‘forced marriage and honour based abuse’.  
It is 7 hours in length and provided by Panahghar Safehouse, a specialist ‘by and for’ BME women’s organisation accredited by Imkaan.
12. Is honour-based abuse and forced marriage included within your safeguarding training framework?

Yes
13. Who delivers your honour-based abuse and forced marriage training? For example, external provider, in house/internally? If this is provided by an external provider, please state who this is. 

We have an external partner who delivers training both internally (to council staff) and externally (to partners)
14. How is the local authority assured that the honour-based abuse and forced marriage training provider is suitably qualified to deliver the training?

The Council does not hold this information and this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held.
15. How many times has honour-based abuse and forced marriage training been provided between 01.04.2018 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.2020 31.03.2021?

· 01/04/18 – 31/03/19 Honour Based Violence (HBV) specific x 1; BME communities x 2

· 01/04/19 – 31/03/20 Combined course x 2

· 01/04/20 – 31/03/21 Combined course x 1

16. How many people have attended/completed training between 01.04.2018 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.2020 31.03.2021?

· 01/04/18 – 31/03/19 HBV 12; BME 17

· 01/04/19 – 31/03/20 Total x 18

· 01/04/20 – 31/03/21 Total x 6

17. Which types of professionals have attended honour-based abuse and forced marriage training between 01.04.2018 – 31.03.19, 01.04.19 – 31.03.20, & 01.04.2020 31.03.2021? For example, social workers, police officers, voluntary sector. 

· We cannot break this down by course as all identifying information has been deleted in line with data retention and as such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
· 18/19: CITY COUNCIL – Adult Social Care & Commissioning, Adult Social Care & Safeguarding, Community Safety, Children Social Care & Early Help; HR, Housing, Leicester Adult Skills & Learning Services (LASAL), Learning & Inclusion.  OTHER: Voluntary Sector, Education/Schools, District Councils, Health, Housing, Solicitors, Childcare.

· 19/20: CITY COUNCIL – Adult Social Care & Commissioning, Adult Social Care & Safeguarding, Children Social Care & Early Help, Housing, LASALs, Learning & Inclusion. OTHER: Voluntary Sector, Education/Schools, District Councils, Health, Housing.

· 20/21: CITY COUNCIL – ASC & Commissioning, ASC & Safeguarding, Children Social Care & Early Help, Housing, Capital Programmes. OTHER – Voluntary Sector, Education/Schools, District Councils, Health

18. Please provide a copy of the training material.

Training material is not held by the Council therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by Leicester City Council
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
