FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request details regarding the fees paid by Leicester City Council for supported accommodation and residential placements for young people aged 16–18.

Please provide the following information for the most recent full financial year (1 April 2024 – 31 March 2025) and, where available, the current financial year to date (2025/26):

1. The average weekly fee paid per placement for:

a) Supported accommodation (16–18)

b) Residential placements with 24-hour staff cover (16–18)


Please include any bandings or placement categories used (e.g. solo, shared, high/medium/low support).

Response: 
	Placement type
	Average weekly fee (per week)

	Supported accommodation (16–18)
	£1565 

	Residential placements with 24-hour staff cover (16–18)
	£6080 


2. The minimum and maximum weekly fees paid for each of the above placement types.

	Placement type
	Minimum (per week)
	Maximum (per week)

	Supported accommodation (16–18)
	£407.53 
	£10,150 

	Residential placements with 24-hour staff cover (16–18)
	£3624
	£12,808


3. The total gross expenditure on:
a) Supported accommodation (16–18)
b) Residential placements with 24-hour staff cover (16–18)

	Placement type
	Total gross expenditure 

	Supported accommodation (16–18)
	£8,961,838.25

	Residential placements with 24-hour staff cover (16–18)
	£7,838,018.65


4. The total number of young people placed and the total number of placement-weeks purchased for each category.

	Placement type
	Total number of young people placed 

	Supported accommodation (16–18)
	134

	Residential placements with 24-hour staff cover (16–18)
	39


Leicester City Council does not hold the information requested on the total number of placement-weeks purchased. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Whether the fees quoted above are inclusive of support hours. If not, please provide details of the typical hourly rates for support and the usual number of support hours commissioned per week.

The fees quoted above for the supported accommodation are inclusive of support hours. The usual number of hours commissioned per week is a minimum of 6. 

In residential placements, support hours are not commissioned as 24/7 care is provided. 

6. Whether these placements are commissioned via a framework/Dynamic Purchasing System (DPS) or spot purchased. If a framework or DPS is used, please specify which one.
All residential placements are commissioned via spot purchase. The majority of supported accommodation placements are commissioned via spot purchase with a number commissioned via frameworks with 3 providers. 

7. Any standard pricing schedules, banding descriptors, or commissioning guidance used by the Council in relation to supported accommodation and residential placements for this age group.

Not applicable.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.


If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk

Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
