Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Misogyny and Sexual Harassment in Schools
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding misogyny-related behaviour and sexual harassment in schools within your local authority area. Please provide the following:
1. Misogyny-Related School Exclusions
· The number of pupils excluded (both temporary and permanent exclusions) due to misogynistic, sexist, or harassment-related behaviour for each of the past six academic years (2018/19 to 2024/25).
Answer:

Nil for the period above

· A breakdown by school year, gender of excluded pupils, and type of incident where available.
N/A
2. Andrew Tate-linked Disruptions in Schools
· Any reports received from schools about incidents where students referenced Andrew Tate in a way that led to classroom disruption, safeguarding concerns, or disciplinary action (2022–present).
Nil

· Any internal guidance, correspondence, or advice issued to schools regarding Andrew Tate’s influence on pupils.

The Prevent education officer provided schools with links to resources (a combination of DfE resources and other education resources) that teachers could use in their classroom.  These have been uploaded on to the schools extranet and are accessible at any time:
· Misogyny and Andrew Tate (Votes for Schools)
How to talk to young people about the rise of internet misogyny

· How to respond to boys inspired by Andrew Tate (TES Magazine)
Assistant headteacher Mark Roberts shares his advice on how to tackle the issue

· Addressing misogyny, toxic masculinity and social media influence through PSHE education (PSHE Association)
Equip pupils with the skills and strategies to recognise and challenge discriminatory behaviours and attitudes

· Violent misogyny and violent extremism and radicalization that lead to terrorism (Organisation for Security and Co-operation in Europe)
· The 'Manosphere' (Institute for Strategic Dialogue)
The ‘manosphere’ is an umbrella term that refers to a number of interconnected misogynistic communities

· Making misogyny a hate crime - policy paper (Home Office)
Police, Crime, Sentencing and Courts Bill 2021 factsheet

· Labour MP 'bombarded with death and rape threats' after condemning Andrew Tate ​(Sky news)
· Misogyny, red pills and extreme figures (Connect Futures)
How to approach the online space with young people in 2023

· Stand by Her (Communities inc)
Being an effective ally to women

· Our Vision - Educators are changemakers / Andrew Tate toolkit (Bold Voices)
3. Teacher Training on Tackling Misogyny
· Any training programmes, guidance, or policies introduced by the local authority to help teachers address misogyny, online radicalisation, or incel ideology among students.

This is included within our current Prevent training programme that is delivered to schoolteachers and safeguarding leads. 
The Council holds this information however relies on the Section 24 (1) ‘National Security’ and Section 31 (1) (a) ‘Law Enforcement’ exemptions. 
Public Interest Test
Section 24 (1) ‘National Security’ and Section 31 (1) (a) ‘Law Enforcement’ are qualified exemptions and therefore are subject to the public interest test as set out in section 2 (2) of the Freedom of Information Act. The Council must therefore decide if the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosing the information.
Section 24 (1) –
(1) Information which does not fall within section 23 (1) is exempt information if exemption from section 1 (1) (b) is required for the purpose of safeguarding national security.

Section 31 (1) (a) –
Information which is not exempt information by virtue of section 30 is exempt information if its disclosure under this Act would, or would be likely to, prejudice –
(a) the prevention or detection of crime
Public Interest in Favour of Disclosure

The Council acknowledges the general public interest in the disclosure of information. It recognises that openness in central government may increase public trust and engagement. 
There is a strong public interest for the Council to demonstrate openness, transparency and accountability with regards to the FOIA in respect of its activities.

The Council considers the transparency in the conduct of public affairs to be very important. It recognises that it is in the public interest that Local Authority processes are shown to be followed and implemented transparently.

Disclosure of this information would confirm Leicester City Council’s commitment to these principles.

Public Interest in maintaining the exemption.

The Council has considered the following with regards to applying the Section 24 (1) ‘National Security’ and Section 31 (1) (a) ‘Law Enforcement’ exemptions:

· Disclosing such detailed descriptions and operational information containing intelligence and detailed information regarding how the Prevent system operates locally could undermine their effectiveness and be used in a manner which threatens National Security and could be used for criminal activity.

· As part of wider counter terrorism efforts, the Council employs a range of programmes to safeguard susceptible individuals and the public. The nature of these programmes means that there is sometimes limited information about them in the public domain. Disclosing such detailed descriptions and operational information containing intelligence and detailed information on how the Prevent system operates locally could undermine their effectiveness and be used for criminal activity.

· This information could be used by individuals or groups to devise counter strategies to these programmes, weakening their effectiveness and expose susceptible individuals to a greater risk of being drawn into terrorism. If more people are drawn into terrorism this would increase the national security threat to the UK. There is a serious terrorism threat to the United Kingdom and the Information Commissioner recognises that terrorists are highly motivated and will go to great lengths to gather intelligence and achieve their goals. The piecing together of even the most harmless information could assist terrorists when put together with other information they may obtain.

· Disclosure of information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 is a disclosure to the world at large, not only the requestor. By placing it into the public domain we make it available to those who would pose a risk to identified individuals, our national security and be used for criminal activity.

Balance of the public interest

The Council has considered the public interest test and finds that maintaining the exemptions outweighs the public interest in disclosing the information.

The disclosure of information under the Freedom of Information Act is a release of this information into the public domain and not only to the requestor. It is the belief of the Council that the release of this information into the public domain and the world at large would place it in the public domain would undermine the effectiveness of the Council and Governments approach to Prevent and the prevention of crime making it available to those who would pose a risk to any identified individuals, our national security and use it for criminal activity.

· The number of teachers or schools that have received such training since 2020.
This information is not recorded. Therefore, exemption Section 1.1 of the Act apply -information not held by the Council.
4. Reports of Sexual Harassment in Schools
· The number of sexual harassment reports (both pupil-on-pupil and staff-on-pupil) made to schools in each of the past five academic years.

· A breakdown of the type of incident reported (e.g., verbal harassment, physical harassment, online harassment).

· The number of cases that resulted in disciplinary action or referral to external agencies.
The Council has data on suspensions and permanent exclusions and can confirm that in those records, there is no detail which relates to the request (we are not required to collect and store details of incidents), so it is nil return.
Schools may hold this detail. Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to the Schools’ Directory page:
https://schoolinfo.leicester.gov.uk/DirectorySearch.html
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
