FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please provide the following information for the council’s own social housing stock:

 

DAMP AND MOULD

1. For the financial year 2024/25:

a. The total number of repair requests reported by tenants that were damp or mould-related.

1,524

b. Of these, the number categorised as emergency hazards, and the number where the investigation started within 24 hours of the report being made.

We currently do not capture data in this way and are working towards capturing this in line with Awaab’s Law Implementation on 27TH October 2025. However, we do currently have internal escalation processes where we identify scenarios which would be defined as an emergency.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
c. The number categorised as significant hazards, and the number where the investigation started within 10 working days of the report being made.

The council currently operates with a different categorisation compared to that used within the FOIA request. The council currently uses a P1 and P2 category system which is being reviewed and amended to bring it in line with Awaab’s Law. As such, we do not have the data available for compliance with a 10-day KPI for investigations.  Again, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
d) Your category labels/definitions used for triage (e.g., how you define emergency, significant/urgent, routine). If you use different labels, please map them to “emergency” and “significant”.

· Priority 1 (4 weeks to complete remedial works) – urgent 

· Priority 2 (8 weeks to complete remedial works) – non-urgent

The council’s full Damp and Mould Policy is available on Leicester City Council’s website. 

damp-and-mould-policy-2025.pdf
(If you do not record an explicit “investigation start” timestamp, please base the counts on the earliest of: first inspection/diagnostic visit/first attendance, and state which proxy you used).

 

ALL REPAIRS

2. For 2024/25 (including damp/mould): 

a. The total number of repair requests reported.

101,383

b. The overall average number of calendar days between the repair request being reported and the repair being completed (no category breakdown needed).

26.83

3. The total annual spend on housing repairs and maintenance (revenue and capital combined, if available) for each of these years - 2022/23, 2023/24 and 2024/25.

An exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.

For revenue spend please refer to the Housing Revenue Account section within the Statement of Account for the relevant years from the following links:

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending/statement-of-accounts/.
For capital spend, please refer to the Housing Revenue Account lines within the Capital Outturn report for the relevant years from the links below:

2022/23

https://cabinet.leicester.gov.uk/documents/s144528/Capital%20Budget%20Monitoring%20-%20P12%202022-23.pdf.pdf
2023/24

https://cabinet.leicester.gov.uk/documents/s155885/Capital%20Outturn%20Report%202023-24%20-%20OSC%20Final.pdf.pdf
2024/25

https://cabinet.leicester.gov.uk/documents/s164558/Decision%20Report%20-%20Capital%20Outturn%202024-25.pdf.pdf
4. The total budget for housing repairs and maintenance (revenue and capital combined, if available) for 2025/26 and 2026/27 (budget or forecast, if available)

2025/26

Please refer to the budget report in the link below:

https://cabinet.leicester.gov.uk/documents/s160492/HRA%20Budget%20Report%20-%20Council%202025%202026%20002.pdf.pdf
Budgets for 2026/27 are not held at the present. 

5. A breakdown of any additional budget allocated, or staff roles created (FTE), since April 2024 to prepare for the implementation of Awaab’s Law. If no separate budget has been identified, please state “none.”

Full costs not yet known but establishment and budgetary growth is expected.

6. Any plans or reports relating to preparation for the implementation of Awaab's Law. 

To help towards preparation for Awaab’s Law, a Joint Strategic Needs Assessment was undertaken in 2024 with contributions from Housing, Social Care and Public Health to provide a holistic approach to how we deal with damp and mould as a council. Individual service workshops have been implemented following this to support the implementation and restructure as necessary. Any shareable reports relating to damp and mould or housing repairs will be available on the council’s website. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
