Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: information requests
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. Please supply your last eight complete quarters of info (so covering 2021/22 and 2022/23 financial years) showing:
· Number of FOIs 
(a) submitted 
(b) responded to on time
(c) refused 
Answer:
This information is available via the Council’s open data platform at
https://data.leicester.gov.uk/explore/dataset/freedom-of-information-foi-code/table/?sort=period
This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible to the applicant by other means.
(d) internally reviewed 
2021 Q1 - 3

2021 Q2 - 6

2021 Q3 - 5

2021-22 Q4 - 7

2022 Q1 - 9

2022 Q2 - 7

2022 Q3 - 3

2022-23 Q4 - 6

(e) reviewed by ICO
Zero for time periods requested.

· How many different individuals submitted requests?
· How many FOIs did each of the top 10 most prolific requesters send?
This will take over 18 hours to complete. We would have to manually go through every single FOI request on InCase and then compile a list of each individual names and will then have to remove people who then appear more than once.

We estimate it will take 5 minutes per InCase file, further time to add all individuals to a spreadsheet and then further time to cross check the individual names to remove all the duplicate names.

It will take 5 minutes per case (907 in 2021 and 1007 in 2022)

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, along with locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The Council has duly determined that to undertake such an exercise would exceed the limit specified above.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of Section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific.
· Of the requests that were refused, how many related to FOIA section 14 (vexatious requests)?

1 request – year 2021 - Quarter 3 

· Number of EIRs (a) submitted (b) responded to on time (c) refused (d) internally reviewed (e) reviewed by ICO
· How many different individuals submitted requests?

· How many EIRs did each of the top 10 most prolific requesters send?

· Of the requests that were refused, how many were deemed manifestly unreasonable on grounds of being vexatious?

EIR is not logged separately by the Council. This is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
· Number of SARs (a) submitted 
2021: 

259 Subject Access Requests were submitted in 2021. The quarterly breakdown can be found in the table below.

	Quarter 1 (Jan – Mar)
	23
	21
	37

	Quarter 2 (Apr – June)
	23
	30
	28

	Quarter 3 (July – Sept)
	22
	25
	16

	Quarter 4 (Oct – Dec)
	13
	13
	8


2022:

254 Subject Access Requests were submitted in 2021. The quarterly breakdown can be found in the table below.

	Quarter 1 (Jan – Mar)
	23
	22
	17

	Quarter 2 (Apr – June)
	19
	14
	17

	Quarter 3 (July – Sept)
	21
	23
	18

	Quarter 4 (Oct – Dec)
	19
	18
	17


· (b) responded to on time 
For 2021 - 258 out of 259 requests were responded to on time

For 2022 – 253 out of 254 requests were responded to on time

· (c) refused
Information not held. We do not record on the number of subject access requests that have been refused outright. When we close a subject access request on the system it is either closed as: ‘closed’, ‘closed – no clarification/ID’ or ‘closed – LATE’ (it is closed late if the final response exceeds the final due date)

We do not record this on our logging system, and we would have to manually trawl through every single SAR for that calendar year and go through each final response to see if a request was refused outright.

This would be 259 requests for 2021 and 254 requests for 2022. It is estimated to take 10 minutes per request. Exemption Section 12 of the Act applies here.
·  (d) internally reviewed 
2021 Q1 - 2

2021 Q2 - 1

2021 Q3 - 1

2021-22 Q4 - 0

2022 Q1 - 7

2022 Q2 - 2

2022 Q3 - 2

2022-23 Q4 - 6

· (e) reviewed by ICO

2021 Q1 - 1

2021 Q2 - 2

2021 Q3 - 1

2021-22 Q4 - 0

2022 Q1 - 2

2022 Q2 - 0

2022 Q3 - 1

2022-23 Q4 - 0

· Relevant KPIs for each of the above, per quarter, for comparison with actual performance

ICO FOI Target 90%
KPI FOI Internal target 95%

KPI SAR Internal target 100%

2.
For the five completed years before that (2016/17 to 2020/21), please provide annual stats showing the total number of FOIs, EIRs and SARs and the percentage responded to on time, plus relevant KPIs.

Numbers of FOI/EIR requests for those calendar years are as follows:

	Year
	FOI/EIR 
	Response rate

	2015
	1217
	98.5%

	2016
	1371
	98%

	2017
	1202
	98%

	2018
	1113
	97%

	2019
	1088
	98%

	2020
	904
	91%

	2021
	907
	99%

	2022
	1007
	98%


Numbers of SAR requests for those calendar years are as follows:

	Year
	SAR 
	Response rate

	2015
	187
	96%

	2016
	177
	97%

	2017
	158
	91%

	2018
	145
	92.5%

	2019
	187
	99%

	2020
	206
	95%

	2021
	259
	99.8%

	2022
	229
	99.9%


KPI FOI Internal target 95%

KPI SAR Internal target 100%

3.
For each of the same past seven years, please supply a list of the staff roles employed by your council and including a dedicated duty to information rights work, including but not limited to handling FOIs, EIRs and SARs, including whether these roles were full- or part-time and whether they were filled or vacant.

	Head of Information Governance & Risk
	x 1
	Full-time

	Information Governance & Risk Manager
	x 1
	Full-time

	Information Risk Officer
	x 1
	Full-time

	Information Governance Officer
	x 2
	Full-time

	Information Governance Assistant
	x 2
	Full-time


4.
For each of the same past seven years, how much did the local authority spend altogether on handling (a) FOIs (b) EIRs (c) SARs?

Information not held. Data cannot be split in this way as staff do more than just these tasks, and staff all over the LA may be asked to undertake some FOI work and this time is not recorded. 
5.
Please provide all guidelines and related documents that are used when processing FOI requests. I expect this to include all guidelines and related documents that are used when refusing requests, as well as documents relating to updates on FOI case law.

Exemption Section 21 applies – information accessible elsewhere. Policies are available on our website here, bottom page: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/
+ See attached

6.
Please provide all FOI training materials that the council holds. I expect this to include guidelines, briefings, and such documents, including presentation slides.
See attached

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
