Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
Re: child social services
Your requests for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

Please Note: There are some questions posed where much research is available on the relevant subject matter.  It is not for the Local Authority therefore to respond.  
The Local Authority will not ‘hazard a guess’ in response to questions, and that individual circumstances will warrant individual assessments/responses.  
Where there is data available or where procedure dictates activity, this is responded to (see below)

Request 1
1. Is there any connection between childhood experiences and future parenting abilities. Can you supply evidence to back up your response.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Do professionals like Cafcass, Guardian ad litem, Psychologists etc have access to child social services paperwork prior to doing their assessments? If so what type of information is shared and is this only in child social services vs parents or also in custody disputes?

CAFCASS (Guardians) have access to the documents submitted within the court process, usually the documents filed by the Local Authority alongside any care application.  
The Guardian may request access to the file for further information.  
The court will direct the Local Authority to provide any relevant information to any experts identified as part of the proceedings.  
In private law matters (where custody disputes are managed) Guardians may seek information from children’s social care to determine if there is any current involvement with the family.  In such cases or when the court specify, the court will direct the Local Authority to provide details of involvement, usually in report form, summarising the involvement.

3. Do child social services share paperwork, even historical with other child social services areas for example from Coventry to South Yorkshire and if so under what circumstances?

When families who have involvement with children’s social care move to another area, Local Authorities are required to request a transfer which will ensure relevant information is shared.  This is set out in safeguarding procedures.  

4. How often is misinformation passed between different child social services areas and what can the person that misinformation pertains to do about it?

As 1 above. 

If an individual believes that incorrect information is recorded about them by organisations, they can exercise their rights under Data Protection legislation to acquire a copy, have the information rectified, erased or restricted.
Request 2

1. What is the council's position on Victim blaming and does the council believe that it is down to the victim to stop their abusive partner from abusing them?

As 1 in above request
2. How often does child social services get involved with families where at least one parent was known to child social services during their childhood? Can you explain why this happens. Do the percentages change if the parent was once a looked after child?

The Council do not collect this data – to manually check this would take longer than the 18 hours.  This is therefore a refusal under the provisions of Section 12(1) of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.
3. How often is previous family court paperwork used again at a future point against either the original parents in the case or the children in the case? 

This Data is not collected and as such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by the Council.
4. How many times does a parent need to pass a parenting assessment before they are no longer required to take part in a parenting assessment? Is this subjective to new allegations?

As 1 in above request
If you can not supply exact numbers for the 'how often' questions can you hazard a guess or a percentage or give the council's opinion regarding the questions please.
Request 3

1. How often does child social services victim blame a domestic abuse victim / survivor?

2. How long do you need to be separated or divorced from a domestic abuse perpetrator before child social services accept that you have nothing to do with your abuser? Accept you are a separate entity.

In respect of Qs. 1 & 2, the Council does not hold the requested information and therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act- information not held.

3.  How often do child social services help a domestic abuse victim, how long does it take for them to help and how long does that help continue for?

This data is not collected in this format, and as such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act- information not held by the Council.
4. Does the council or child social services believe there is a connection between domestic abuse/ violence and the victim suffering from Stockholm syndrome? Has the council or social services done any studies to prove or disprove this theory?

As above 1 & 2.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
