Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Career Breaks and Sabbaticals
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding career breaks and sabbaticals taken by employees within your organisation (council).

I would like to request the following information covering the period from 2020 to present:

This is the timeframe/breakdown I would like to receive the data for please:
1st January 2020 – 31st December 2020
1st January 2021 - 31st December 2021
1st January 2022 – 31st December 2022
1st January 2023 – 31st December 2023
1st January 2024 - 31st December 2024
1st January 2025 – 30th April 2025

1. The total number of employees who have taken career breaks or sabbaticals lasting more than one month.

2. A breakdown of these career breaks by: 
o Length of break (1-3 months, 4-6 months, 7-12 months, more than 12 months)
o Department or service area (if available)
o Employee grade or level (junior, middle management, senior management)
o Employee age
o Employee gender

3. The main reasons given for these career breaks, categorised if possible (e.g., further education, travel, family responsibilities, volunteering, personal development).

4. The number of employees who returned to work following their career break.

5. Any notable patterns in the timing of career breaks (e.g., particular months or seasons when more employees take breaks).

Answer:

In respect of Qs1-5, we do not record any leave as career break or sabbatical. This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. A copy of your current policy on career breaks and sabbaticals.

Please see attached section of the conditions of service where unpaid leave is stated.

S4.17 of the T&C provides for unpaid leave of any duration where no costs incur to the council.  This condition is akin to career break schemes in other organisations on an unpaid basis.  The relevant section is below.

4.17 Unpaid leave 

Directors may grant at their discretion unpaid leave of any duration to employees where no cost occurs for the council i.e. the employee elects not to make pension contributions beyond the statutory minimum and there are no recruitment costs for a replacement. 

Where some or all of these costs occur, Directors may grant at their discretion a period of unpaid leave of up to one year. Unpaid leave, where such costs occur, for a period exceeding one year, must have the approval of the appropriate Committee. 

No deductions of pay will be made for weekends and bank holidays which fall within a period of absence of two weeks or less. Annual Leave will not accrue during periods of unpaid leave greater than one week except for the statutory maternity pay period. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
