Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
I would like to request the following FOI.
If you can not supply all statistics please supply the ones you can within the given time framework allowed. LAC means looked after child by child social services.

1. How many LAC have run away or disappeared in your area each calendar year for the past 10 years.
	2015
	73
	 

	2016
	92
	 

	2017
	93
	 

	2018
	93
	 

	2019
	92
	 

	2020
	70
	 

	2021
	59
	to 31 July 2021


Prior to 2015, the information requested is not recorded in a reportable format.  Staff would need to trawl through the records of all LAC children to establish if there had been a period of absence.  
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act for this part of your request.

2. How many LAC have died from any cause in your area each calendar year for the past 10 years. 
0.

If you do not hold the statistics on any of these questions please let me know which questions you can not readily respond to when you respond to the statistics of the ones readily available on your system.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
