Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: council bailiffs
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please provide the following in relation to bailiffs/enforcement agents used by your council. Treat “bailiffs” as “enforcement agents” under the Taking Control of Goods regime, and include information held by the council or on its behalf by contractors.

1. Refunds (financial years 2022/23 to 2025/26)

For each year (2025/26 to the date you run the search), the number and total value of refunds issued due to overcharging (e.g. fees beyond the Taking Control of Goods (Fees) Regs 2014, duplicated/incorrect fees, misapplied VAT, unlawful attendance/withdrawal fees).

Please break this down by (a) enforcement company and (b) debt type (e.g. council tax, business rates, parking/PCNs, housing arrears).

Answer:

This information is not held by the council and would need to be requested from the enforcement company. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


2. Findings (2022/23 to 2025/26)

Any findings of maladministration, misconduct, or breach of statutory guidance/codes of practice against bailiffs/enforcement agents acting for the council, broken down by year and company.

The number of complaints upheld about enforcement agents (please state whether internal, Ombudsman, or court).

This information is not held by the council and would need to be requested from the enforcement company. According to section 1(1)(a) of the FOIA the authority does not have access to the information of the description specified in the request.


3. Fee type split (most recent full year only)

A breakdown of fees collected by bailiffs/enforcement agents, by fee type (compliance, enforcement, sale/disposal, disbursements), with totals by company.

Please provide figures in spreadsheet format (CSV/Excel). For narrative material (e.g. reports, findings, correspondence), PDF/Word is fine. If some detail would exceed the s12 cost limit, please provide headline yearly totals first, and then the most recent full year with full breakdowns. If no data is held for part, please record a nil return.
This information is commercially sensitive and cannot be disclosed under section 43 of the Freedom of Information Act. 

Section 43(2) provides an exemption from disclosure where to release information would, or would be likely to prejudice the commercial interests of any party (including the Public Authority holding it). 
Disclosure of the requested information could prejudice pending or future negotiations the Council may be subject to.
This is a qualified exemption under the FOI Act which means that consideration must also be given to whether in all the circumstances of the case the public interest favouring disclosure is greater than the public interest in maintaining the exemption. The public interest means what is in the best interests of the public not what is of interest to the public. 
Public interest test considerations
We have considered whether the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosing the information. There are a number of public interest arguments that weigh in favour of disclosing the information you have sought: 

• The general proposition of maximising openness that the FOIA and the Council aspire to; 

• The benefits of ensuring transparent and accountable government by disclosing how the Council receives and spends public money; 

However, there are also public interest arguments against disclosure: 

• Releasing the requested information could prejudice the Council’s current or future negotiation capabilities. 
The public interest in withholding the requested information outweighs the public interest in disclosure of the requested information. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
