Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: homeless data 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. Any data collected on who turns down support offered by local authority outreach teams. This could include demographic/circumstantial information (i.e. why they refuse/where they are staying) on who disengages and the number of people 

Looking at the summary information for this financial year, around 26% of rough sleepers encountered refuse the offers of accommodation made by outreach teams.  This information is based on single night snapshots, and is anonymised, so cannot form an answer to the above.

This information needed to answer this question fully is not held in a reportable format, and therefore it is not possible to produce it in the timescales as this would involve going through record by record manually counting. I estimate that this would take us approximately 15 minutes per record resulting in only being able to check around 60 records.  This is less than one month’s worth and only a small selection would fall into the category of having turned down support.  It would therefore be unlikely to give a representative cross section.  As a result of this, we are providing the data as more qualitative information.
From the outcomes of referral data, the main reasons for rough sleepers disengaging and turning down support are entrenchment, breakdown in relationships with support services, a lack of comprehensive understanding on what support is on offer and how they can access it. Sometimes, they are not accepting of the types of offer available, i.e., hostel accommodation.
2. Any data collected on people who stay in squats, including the number of people who are arrested or cautioned for squatting in the local authority
Leicester City Council does not hold the requested information and is advising you of this as required by Section 1(1) of the Act. Information on arrests and cautions occurring in Leicester would be held by Leicestershire Police and as part of our duty to advise and assist requesters, we recommend that you contact them directly for this information. They can be contacted via:

Accessing information | Leicestershire Police (leics.police.uk)
3. Any data collected on people residing in unconventional accommodation types such as temporary structures
This information is not held in a reportable format, and therefore it is not possible to produce it in the timescales as this would involve going through record by record to check if this applied to the case in question.  I estimate that this would take us approximately 15 minutes per record, so similarly to question 1, we would only be able to check 60 records (or 30 for question 1 and 30 for question 3) before the request fell outside of the time limits.
We can advise qualitatively, however, that the Council have encountered some encampments in City areas that have been dealt with as they’ve emerged.  These have consisted of tents but no other temporary structures.
4. A breakdown of where people are counted in local rough sleeping snapshots (e.g., cars, sheds, doorways)
Parks, doorways, vehicles (i.e., cars, vans, caravans), car parks, squats, stairwells in blocks of flats, sheds (only if reported to the Council through the local Street link service).
5. Data collected on the number of people staying in overcrowded and concealed households and any accompanying demographic information such as sex, age, ethnicity. 
Please see Appendix 1 to this response, regarding housing applications received by the Council. Please note however, that this data set is only those households that have applied to the city council’s housing register. As such this is not a full picture of overcrowding in the city as there are many households that are overcrowded that have not made an application for social housing.
6.
Data collected on the number of people who “sofa surf” or stay temporarily in the homes of others. 
Please see Appendix 2 to this response, regarding housing applications received by the Council. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
