FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Freedom of Information request regarding twining agreements with Chinese Cities

We are writing to make a Freedom of Information request for copies of all twinning agreements between UK and Chinese cities. Specifically, we would like to request the following information:
• All twinning agreements signed between UK local government bodies and Chinese cities, including the date of the agreement, the names of the UK local government bodies and Chinese cities involved, and any details about the nature of the twinning relationship.
Leicester and Chongqing signed an official twinning agreement in 1993.  At that time it was hoped the link would strengthen business and cultural ties between the cities.

• Any documents or correspondence related to the twinning agreements, including emails, letters, memorandums, and other relevant materials deemed to be in scope of this request.
We do not hold a copy of the final signed twinning agreement. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  We have enclosed a blank copy for reference
• Any reports or assessments conducted by UK government bodies regarding the twinning agreements, including any assessments of the benefits or risks associated with the agreements.
In 2016, the Government commissioned a review of twinning and contact between British and Chinese cities as part of the Government’s Foresight Future of Cities Project, which included a review of Sino-British twinning relations as well as the implications. We have enclosed a copy of the review on “Twinning and contact between British and Chinese cities” for reference.

• Any details about the financial or material support provided by UK government bodies to support the twinning agreements, including any grants or other forms of financial assistance.

· The City Council funded the Leicester & Chongqing China Association until the end of March 2002.  We do not hold any information regarding any grants or funding provided.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

· Thereafter, the city and the county’s interests were in the main represented by the County Council who had a long-standing friendship with Sichuan Province in China involving economic, educational and civic twinning.  The friendship was consolidated with the establishment in March 2004 of the Leicester Shire - China Trade Bureau, which resulted in a number of successful trade missions headed by the County Council in partnership with the Leicester Shire Economic Partnership and the UK Trade and Investment.  The Bureau was later known as the East Midlands China Business Bureau and operated at a regional level. 

· On 4th August 2008, the City Council hosted a visit by a delegation from Chongqing, led by Dr Shirong Li, who was the Deputy Director General of Chongqing Foreign Trade and Economic Relations Commission of Chongqing Government.  The delegation’s visit to Leicester was part of a wider UK visit and included the signing of two Memorandums of Understanding (see copies attached).  The visit identified three cooperation strands:

1. Trade as a key driver; 

2. University links;

3. Chinatown (the Leicester Chongqing Economic Development Group was set up to look at the project’s feasibility); 

4. Cooperation around the Science Park development.

· In 2009, the Mayor of Chongqing invited the then Lord Mayor (Manjula Sood) and Councillor Kitterick to attend the Chongqing International Investment and Global Sourcing Fair.  This was Chongqing’s most important and high profile annual event.  Several expressions of interest had been received from Leicester businesses prior to the visit but unfortunately at the very last stage these businesses had to withdraw from the visit.  Councillor Sood was only the first Lord Mayor to visit Chongqing since the twinning agreement was signed.  They were particularly interested to invite this Lord Mayor being the first female Asian Lord Mayor in the UK, as they were very keen to encourage women into what was a male dominated world of politics and senior government positions.  During the visit the Lord Mayor undertook the following:

· Met with the Consulate-General and his team, who joint hosted the programme;

· Visited the Federation of Women’s Organisations of Chongqing;

· Attended a high level meeting with the Leader of Chongqing;

· Visited the Headteacher and pupils at Baxian School;

· Attended the 12th Chongqing International Investment and Global Sourcing Fair;

· Attended a high level VIP meeting with Leaders from around the globe;

· Attended a high level meeting with the Mayor of Chongqing;

· Tour of light railway;

· Met with the Principal of Chongqing University and discussed the Confucius project;

· Met with the Deputy Director General of Chongqing Foreign Trade and Economic Relations Commission of Chongqing Government;

· Had a tour of Chongqing Museum and visited a Buddhist Temple.

There was an enormous amount of media interest surrounding the Lord Mayor’s visit, and both the Chongqing Daily Newspaper and a National Women’s magazine held lengthy meetings with the Lord Mayor about her visit.

· In November 2009, the City Council hosted a visit by the Chongqing Women Federation who were keen to learn about Leicestershire's Domestic Violence Integrated Response Project.
In more recent years the City Council has not had a particularly active relationship with Chongqing, and there have not been any further visits or any significant engagement in the last ten years.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
