FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Answer
The Council holds some of the information you have asked for.
Reports of Obstruction from Private Land:
1. How many reports or complaints regarding overgrown vegetation and foliage obstructing footways, originating from private land were received by your authority in the past two years (2023 and 2024)?

2023: 281 reports

2024: 354 reports
These will be reports about obstruction of the highway from vegetation growing from private or public land, we do not record them separately. The majority of overhanging vegetations issues are noted as part of routine highway safety inspections. 


Reports of Obstruction from Public Land:
2. How many reports or complaints regarding overgrown vegetation and foliage obstructing footways originating from public land were received by your authority in the same period?
As above.

We have also checked our Love Clean streets and we have no reports of vegetation obstruction on the footpaths originating from public land. We are unable to interrogate the complaint system as currently, the system doesn't present that information easily. 
If someone had to check every single complaint enquiry and review the narrative to determine if it relates to "overgrown vegetation obstructing highways and from public land" it would take a significant amount of hours to review 2 years worth of complaint data. 

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We estimate it will take 166 hours to process your request. This is calculated as 2000 complaints x 5 minutes / 60 minutes = 166 hours.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific about what information you particularly wish to obtain, including any dates or period of time relevant to the information required. We do have a duty to advise and assist you in refining your request under s16 of the Act so please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in refining your request.

Actions Taken by the Authority
Enforcement or Intervention on Private Land:
3. For reports concerning overhanging vegetation and foliage from private land, how many led to:
• The landowner being contacted?
• Formal enforcement action?
• Direct intervention by the authority to remove or address the vegetation?
• Penalty fines issued?
We do not hold this information. All reports would be investigated and a letter sent to the property / landowner if required. A follow up inspection would be carried out and a notice sent if the vegetation was still an issue. Cutting back and recovery of our costs may be required very occasionally.  

Length of time for action to be taken
4. On average, how long did each report take to action, from the moment the complaint was received, to the point which the issue was dealt with? 
All reports will be investigated within 10 working days and action started if needed.


5. What is the usual timeframe you state you will deal with overgrown vegetation and foliage in?

Investigate within 10 working days but resolving any obstruction will take longer depending on the response from the landowner. We do not record the time taken to resolve the problem. 


Maintenance of Public Land:
6. What actions were undertaken to address complaints about overgrown vegetation and foliage obstructing footways on public land? Please provide details of:
• The number of cases resolved per year (2023 and 2024).
• The nature of the interventions (e.g., pruning, clearing, etc.).
Obstruction of the highway issues originating from public land are reported to the department which manages the land /building.
Where any issues are identified that are a health and safety risk the area would be cleared. All public land is subject to an annual scheduled prune.

Best Practices and Guidance
Policies or Guidance on Overhanging Vegetation:
7. Does your authority have any specific policies, procedures, or guidance documents on preventing or addressing overgrown vegetation and foliage obstructing footways? If so, please provide copies or links to these documents, ensuring they are in an accessible format for blind and partially sighted people.
They are part of our routine highway safety inspections and officers will record any issues whilst undertaking them.
The Council does not have any policies or guidance regarding public land.  

Examples of Good Practice:
8. Can you provide examples of good practice adopted by your authority to effectively manage overhanging vegetation and foliage issues (e.g., community engagement, educational campaigns, partnerships with landowners, or consultation with disability groups)?
All Council owned trees are subject to a cyclical inspection process to identify any maintenance works.


Coordination with Other Authorities:
9. Has your authority worked with neighbouring councils or external organizations to share resources or best practices for tackling overhanging vegetation? If so, please provide details.
No.

Accessible reporting
10. What is the process of reporting overgrown vegetation and foliage, how many steps are there, and how accessible/easy to find are these processes on your website? (By accessible, we mean how easy is it for a blind or partially sighted person using assistive technology or person with low vision, to access and report it.)
On the Love Clean Street reporting system. This is available via an App or on the Council’s website. 
Leicester City Council is committed to making its websites accessible, in accordance with the Public Sector Bodies (Websites and Mobile Applications) (No. 2) Accessibility Regulations 2018, you can visit our website to find the full  Leicester City Council Accessibility statement. Please note this statement applies only to https://www.leicester.gov.uk/.
Love clean Streets, is supplied through a third party, who have published their own Love Leicester Accessibility Statement for their website. 

The Love Clean Streets mobile application (app) is also fully compliant with the Web Content Accessibility Guidelines version 2.1 AA standard applicable for Mobile Applications and Public Sector Bodies (Websites and Mobile Applications) (No. 2) Accessibility Regulations 2018. 
Please find attached (Attachment 1) the mobile apps full accessibility statement labelled Love Clean Streets App Accessibility.

11. How many reports of overgrown vegetation and foliage did you receive from blind and partially sighted people did you receive in the past two years?
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


Spending and Budget Allocation
Expenditure on Addressing Vegetation Issues:
12. What was the total expenditure allocated and spent by the authority on tackling overhanging vegetation and foliage affecting footways during the past two years? Please break down this spending by:
• Addressing vegetation from public land.
• Addressing vegetation from private land (including enforcement and direct intervention costs).
Highways do not record this information.
We do not allocate a budget to this level of detail.

Additional Budget for Vegetation Management:
13. Has your authority allocated any specific budget or additional funding (e.g., grants, subsidies) to manage overhanging vegetation and foliage? If so, please provide details of the amounts and their use.
No.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
