Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

How many people in total has your authority accommodated (for at least one night) under the ‘Everyone In’, ‘Protect’ or ‘Protect Plus’ initiatives since March 2020?  

As at 28th February 2021 – 874.

Of the total number set out in (1) above, how many people are:

(a) in emergency accommodation; As at 28th February 2021 – 874.
(b) in settled accommodation; 154 - As at 28th February 2021 snapshot
(c) in supported accommodation; 248 - As at 28th February 2021 snapshot
(d) reconnected with family or friends; 21 - As at 28th February 2021 snapshot
(e) no longer accommodated, having left accommodation without move on accommodation; or (f) no longer accommodated, (no destination recorded)?  

We have provided (e) and (f) together as it would take more than 18hrs (estimated 125 hours) to provide them separately due to the way that the data is held.  

247 – Cumulative as at 28th February 2021.
Note that sum of 1(a) to 1(e) does not add up to (1) due to other possible outcomes, for example those reconnected internationally, or reconnected with another local authority.

Of the total number set out in (1) above, how many people have also been recorded by the authority on the H-CLIC recording system as being owed a prevention or relief duty under the Homelessness Reduction Act 2017?  

This data is not held in a way that makes it easily determined.  Arriving at this data would take in excess of the 18 hour FOI Act limit (estimated 40-45 hours) so this information is exempt under section 12 of the FOI Act – exceeds the appropriate limit.
Regarding those not eligible for housing support under the Housing Act 1996, Part 7:

(a) Following the announcement of Everyone In on 26 March 2020, did your authority accommodate people who were ineligible for housing support under that initiative? If so, how many? 

This data is not held in a way that makes it easily determined.  Arriving at this data would take in excess of the 18 hour FOI Act limit (estimated 40-45 hours) so this information is exempt under section 12 of the FOI Act – exceeds the appropriate limit.

(b) Does your authority continue to accommodate people who are ineligible for housing support? If so, how many?

Yes, 16 current persons as at 28th February 2021.
(c) How many people judged to be, or at risk of, sleeping rough have been turned down for housing support since 26th March 2020 because they were judged to be ineligible for housing support?  
69 as at 28th February 2021.

(d) If your authority no longer, as a matter of policy, accommodates people who are ineligible for housing support, when was that policy decision made and for what reason? Please provide a copy of the decision.  
N/A – There is no such policy. LCC still using Powers where deemed appropriate. This is therefore information not held under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
Please provide a copy of your authority’s most recent rough sleeping ‘move on’ plan. This is the plan that was requested to be updated by the end of 2020 by the Secretary of State for Housing and Communities in his announcement of 5 November 2020.

This is accessible elsewhere under section 21 of the FOI Act and can be viewed publicly at https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-community/housing/homelessness/ 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
