Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

For the period 2013/14 - 2021/2022
	1)How many households were in Council Tax arrears each year? 

Of these:

1a) How many households were in Council Tax arrears relating to earlier years?

1b)How many households were in Council Tax arrears relating to in year?
Please see attached spreadsheet.



	2)Of the households in Council Tax Arrears, how many households contained or were:

2a)Someone above the state pension age?

2b)Someone sick or disabled/in receipt of incapacity benefit

2c)A lone parent

2d)Someone who is unemployed

2e)In receipt of Universal Credit

2f)In receipt of Universal Credit and Council Tax Reduction
This is information not held. This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


	3)What is the value of Council Tax Arrears relating to earlier years before write-offs in the current year?


	4)What is the value of Council Tax arrears written off in year relating to the previous year only?


	5)What is the value of Council Tax arrears relating to earlier years?


	6)What is the total value of Council Tax arrears for all previous years as of 31st 
March post write offs?

Of these:

6b) What is the total value of Council Tax arrears in respect of the previous year only?

6c) What is the total value of Council Tax arrears in respect of earlier years?


	7) What is the total value of Council Tax not collected in the current year?


	8) What is the total value of Council Tax written off in year relating to the current year?


	9) What is the total value of Council Tax arrears in respect of the current year outstanding as of 31st March?


	10) What is the total value of Council Tax arrears as of 31st March?


	11) What is the net change in value in arrears outstanding as of 31st March?


	12) What is the total value of court and administration costs relating to Council Tax arrears for the respective year?



Q3 to Q12 – This is exempt from release under s21 of the FOI Act – accessible elsewhere. The information can be found on the GOV.UK website (see last table at Collection rates for Council Tax and non-domestic rates in England, 2021 to 2022 - GOV.UK (www.gov.uk), Quarterly return of Council Tax and non-domestic rates QRC4, 2021 and 2022. 

PDFs of the QRC4 return from 2013/14 to 2019/20 are attached.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
