Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Council Tax Enforcement
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please provide the following information relating to Council Tax liabilities for the financial year 2024/25.

For clarity: this request refers to all Council Tax accounts where liability fell within the period 1 April 2024 to 31 March 2025, regardless of when the bill was issued.

Please include all accounts where liability covered the whole financial year or any part of the financial year, including part-year tenancies and mid-year changes of liability.

1. Council Tax enforcement actions
a. Number of summonses issued for non-payment of council tax
b. Number of Liability Orders granted by magistrates for non-payment of council tax
c. Number of cases referred to enforcement agents (bailiffs)

Answer:
Information for Qs.1a, b & c can be found at Council Tax and Business Rate Recovery — Leicester Open Data. 
This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is reasonably accessible to you by other means.
d. Number of enforcement letters issued by enforcement agents on behalf of the council
247,989 - It is important to note that this figure represents the number of individual notices sent, not the number of households subject to enforcement action. For each enforcement case, multiple statutory and procedural notices are issued at different stages of the recovery process, including prior to action and while enforcement activity is ongoing. Each enforcement action requires a minimum of six separate notices. As a result, the number of households involved is significantly lower than the total number of notices issued.

e. Number of enforcement visits made by enforcement agents on behalf of the council

15,773

2. Fees and charges
a. The summons fee charged
£55.00


b. The Liability Order fee charged
£17.00


c. A breakdown of how these fees are calculated or determined

Please see attached

3. Enforcement agent firms used
a. The names of all enforcement agent companies used by the council for council tax collection, recovery, and enforcement during 2024/25

(Please note: I am requesting only the names of the enforcement firms, not contract values or commercially sensitive information.)

Bristow & Sutor, Newlyn and Marston Holdings  


4. Households in receipt of Council Tax Reduction (CTR)
a. Number of cases referred to enforcement agents where the household was in receipt of CTR
b. Number of Liability Orders granted where the household was in receipt of CTR
c. For Liability Orders involving households on CTR, a split by:
Working-age households
Pension-age households

5. Attachment of Benefits and Attachment of Earnings
a. Number of Attachment of Benefits (AoB) requests sent to DWP (e.g., UC or legacy benefits)
b. Total value of the debt included in AoB requests (regardless of deductions taken)
c. Number of Attachment of Earnings Orders (AoEOs) issued
d. Total value of the debt included in AoEOs
e. Number of households subject to AoEOs who were in receipt of CTR

With regard to Qs. 4 & 5, the Council does not hold the information requested and is advising you in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act -information not held by the Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
