Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re:  £150 support on council tax account
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

The questions below only relate to the “core/main” £150 scheme. No information is required concerning the separate “discretionary” schemes.
For the avoidance of doubt, an eligible property’s £150 is “Unclaimed” in my FoIA request when an eligible occupant has not received the £150 (or already received an equivalent £150 financial benefit) at a specified date. A non-exhaustive example: if the £150 was sitting in an eligible council-tax-exempt property’s tax account waiting to be offset against a future liability or claimed by an eligible occupant, then it is unclaimed.

1) For properties where you are the local council, how many properties have an unclaimed “core” £150 on their council tax account?

Answer:
4,407

2) How many of the properties in “1)” had at least one individual in council tax exemption class N as at 1 April 2022?

1,694

3) For properties where you are the local council, how many are recorded as a Home in Multiple Occupation (HMO) for planning purposes but not for council tax purposes?

This information is not held on the council tax database. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4) How many of these properties in “3)” have an unclaimed “core” £150 on their council tax account and had at least one individual in council tax exemption class N as at 1 April 2022?

N/A – as data for Q3 is not held.

5) What decision(s) has the council made regarding distribution of these unclaimed “core” £150 payments to the eligible 1 April 2022 occupants? 

We have tried to make contact with customers that are eligible, to obtain their bank details to make the payment, if we have not been able to offset the rebate against the previous or current outstanding council tax liability and will continue to do so.  No decision has been made in relation to unclaimed rebates.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
