FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I am requesting the following information relating to use of PSPO’s and CPN powers in your local area between 1 January 2020 and 31 December 2024:

1. Public Spaces Protection Orders (PSPOs):
a. How many PSPOs are currently active in your local area?
4


b. How many were introduced in each year 2020–2024?
One in 2016, 2019 and 2022 and one in 2025

c. If available, what behaviours do these PSPOs restrict (e.g. busking, begging, loitering, amplification, rough sleeping/sleeping in vehicle, feeding birds/animals, car cruising, making noise, swearing or foul/abusive language, gatherings outside abortion clinics)
Within parks and recreation, the majority relate to dog control, dogs on leads, dog exclusion and dog fouling. 

Other information can be found via the following link:

Public Spaces Protection Orders
d. How many Fixed Penalty Notices were issued for breach of PSPOs in this period?
Year     
FPNs Issued

2020

0

2021 

1

2022 

10

2023

9

2024 

4


e. If available, disaggregated data on race, ethnicity, gender, socio-economic status and disability status for PSPOs issued in this period.
This data isn’t collected.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Community Protection Notices (CPNs):
a. How many CPN warnings and full CPNs were issued annually between 2020–2024?

Year     
CPNWs 
 CPNs Issued

2020 

not held*

2021 

973

191

2022 

612

128

2023 

1,253

181

2024 

902

177

* Information for 2020 is not held by Leicester City Council, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000
b. If available, what were the most common reasons for issuing CPNs (e.g. bird feeding, barking dogs, begging, shouting/swearing, messy/overgrown gardens, neighbour disputes, repairing vehicles on the road, loitering, bonfires, breach of PSPO, drug use, sex work) 
Untidy private land is the most common followed by leaving waste on the public highway  

c. How many breaches of CPNs resulted in prosecution or further enforcement?
Year     
further enforcement Prosecutions

2020 

not held*

2021 

3

2022 

5

2023 

1

2024 

1

* Information for 2020 is not held by Leicester City Council, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000
d. If available, disaggregated data on race, ethnicity, gender, socio-economic status and disability status for CPNs issued in this period.

Again, this data isn’t collected.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

If possible, please also briefly outline how this data is typically stored and retained (e.g. database system, format, retention period).

The information is currently held for 5 years and retained on an internal database 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
