Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: enforcement activities
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. Does the Council deliver on-the-ground enforcement functions such as issuing fixed penalty notices for anti-social behaviour, littering and fly-tipping, and if so, how (directly, contracted out, etc.)?
Answer:

Enforcement is undertaken across a number of services, the City Wardens service, Parks Wardens, Civil Enforcement Officers, and the Council’s Antisocial Behaviour team.  None of this work is contracted out.

2. Does the Council deal with abandoned and/or untaxed vehicles, if so, how?
Abandoned vehicle inspections are undertaken by council authorised officers. 
3. Does the Council deal with unlawful encampments and traveller incursions, if so, how?
A small dedicated multi agency team, hosted by Leicestershire County Council manage the unauthorised encampments in line with the Code of Practice for Travellers in Leicestershire, Leicester City and Rutland:
https://directory.leicester.gov.uk/media/19635/foia-1198-attachment.pdf
This part of the letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA as the exemption to disclosure contained at Section 21 of the Act applies, namely the information is already accessible to the applicant by other means as it in the public domain, i.e. published on the Council’s website.

4. If yes to either 1, 2 or 3, does an enforcement strategy exist, and can this be provided?
Unauthorised Encampments are managed in line with the Code of Practice for Travellers in Leicestershire, Leicester City and Rutland:

https://directory.leicester.gov.uk/media/19635/foia-1198-attachment.pdf
A general policy for Leicester City Council can be found at:

Environment, Development and Commercial Services (leicester.gov.uk)
This information is exempt from release under Section 21 of the Act as it can be viewed publicly.
5. In the last 5 financial years, how much has your authority recovered through Fixed Penalty Notices, fines and other actions as a result of enforcement action for these activities?
	01/04/2018 to 18/01/2023

	Offence
	Total

	Fly Tipping
	£71,027.70


	01/04/2018 to 18/01/2023

	Offence
	Total

	Leaving Litter
	£46,505.00


	01/04/2018 to 18/01/2023

	Offence
	Total

	Littering From Vehicle
	£22,700.00


anti-social behaviour
	01/04/2018 to 18/01/2023

	Offence
	Total

	PSPO Failed to Remove Faeces
	£1,110.00


	01/04/2018 to 18/01/2023

	Offence
	Total

	PSPO Permitting Dog to Enter Land Excluding Dogs
	£200.00


6. In the last 5 financial years, how much has been spent on delivering these enforcement activities (for ease, if these form the substantive part of a department or team’s responsibilities, please provide its combined net revenue budget)?

	Total Net Budgets for 2017/18 to 2021/22

For Enforcement

	Year
	Total

	2021/22
	£483800

	2020/21
	£462800

	2019/20
	£549500

	2018/19
	£653500

	2017/18
	£659300


7. Please provide any internal email correspondence and documents (including service reviews and committee reports) which relate to any consideration of reviewing expenditure on the aforementioned enforcement functions within the last 2 years.
This information is not held.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
