FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. The Pension Fund manager fee you pay for your pension fund - as measured both as a percentage of assets under management and also as a cash payment for the financial year 2024/25, or the last financial year you have a figure available for.

2. The performance of your pension fund over the last three financial years that you have the figures for. If possible, please indicate the metrics you record on its performance in terms of:

a) How much your pension pot grew by

b) How it performed relative to the target of your fund managers

c) How it performed relative to other local authorities and

d) How it performed relative to pension funds in the market generally.

If these are not recorded, please provide any performance criteria you do have available.

Leicester City Council does not hold the information you have requested, Leicestershire County Council manages the Leicestershire Pension Fund. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.
You may wish to redirect your request, the following link may be useful:
Freedom of Information requests | Leicestershire County Council
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
