FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am requesting the following information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. If any information is unavailable, exempt, or beyond time/cost limits, please disregard these and provide the rest.

1. Are you on a green/renewable energy tariff for gas and electricity supplies? Please answer individually for both. 

Gas: no. 

Electricity: no.

2. Do you have any renewable energy installations at council-owned properties (both residential and commercial council-owned properties)? 

Yes.

If yes, please list them and include their maximum capacity. Options might include: 

- Solar panels Yes – see information below and in the accompanying spreadsheet
- Solar thermal panels No
- Wind turbines No
- Air source heat pump Yes – see information below and in the accompanying spreadsheet
- Ground source heat pump No
- Biomass systems No
- Hydroelectric systems No
- Other (please specify) No


Council houses - we have 1,218 council houses with roof-mounted PVs fitted. We do not have details of the exact capacity of each array, but when they were installed under the ECO scheme, a capacity of 8KWp was targeted. Some properties fell slightly short of this and others exceeded it slightly, so it can be used as an indicative figure.

Operational Estate properties – refer to the accompanying spreadsheet for details of renewable energy installations at these properties.

Council-managed school buildings - refer to the accompanying spreadsheet for details of renewable energy installations at these properties.

Commercial leased properties – none of our current commercial leased properties (those we lease to other organisations such as businesses) have renewable energy installations.
3. What percentage of commercial council-owned properties have solar panels installed as of 2024 (if this year of data is unavailable, please provide the percentage of commercial council-owned properties that have solar panels installed as of 2023)?

Figure not available. This information is not held.
4. What percentage of residential council-owned properties have solar panels installed as of 2024 (if this year of data is unavailable, please provide the percentage of residential council-owned properties that have solar panels installed as of 2023)? 

6% of council housing homes have solar panels installed as of 2024.

5. What percentage of council-owned properties (both residential and commercial council-owned properties) are powered 100% by sustainable energy as of 2024 (if this year of data is unavailable, please provide the percentage of council-owned properties that are powered 100% by sustainable energy as of 2023)? 

0%

6. Do you have any fully electric vehicles in your fleet for staff use (excluding hybrids)? If yes, how many? 

Yes, we have 36 fully electric vehicles in our fleet, for use on council business.

7. Do you currently employ a staff member whose primary responsibility is overseeing the implementation of sustainability strategies, such as a “Sustainability Officer”? 

We have a post called Change Manager (Climate Emergency) which is responsible for this role in relation to climate change mitigation and adaptation.

8. What eco-friendly initiatives are implemented across your council-owned properties for your staff members to take part in? These could include green transport solutions (e.g. bike schemes), recycling programs, etc. Please describe them. 

· Office waste recycling scheme – segregated collection points for dry recyclables in all council office buildings, covering glass and plastic bottles, paper, card and cans.

· Electric pool bikes – 5 bikes available for use by staff on council business.

· Cycle salary sacrifice scheme – available for all staff to pay for a new bike direct from their salary, saving on income tax and national insurance.

9. What were the estimated annual savings on energy bills from using renewable energy sources for the 2023 calendar year in GBP? 

Information not available. This information is not held.

10. How much energy was sold back to the National Grid annually from your renewable installations for the 2023 calendar year in kWh and GBP? 

Information not available. This information is not held.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
