Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: council tax enforcement
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. In relation to your collection of council tax for the 2022/2023 council tax period please provide the total number of referrals/debts passed to enforcement agents.

2. Please confirm the name of the enforcement company used by the council for the recovery of council tax debt.

Answer:
With regard to Qs 1 and 2, the information can be found at Open Data Council Tax and Business Rate Recovery — Leicester Open Data

This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain i.e. the Council’s website.

3. Please confirm if accounts which are part of the council tax reduction/ support scheme are passed to enforcement companies and if so how many such cases were passed on for the 2022/23 council tax period.

Yes, the council does refer accounts that are in receipt of council tax support. We do not however, keep separate statistics of these cases and as such this is exempt in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the council.

4. Please confirm if accounts of people on health/disability related benefits such as Disability Living Allowance, Employment Support Allowance and Personal Independence Payment are passed to enforcement companies and if so how many such cases were passed on for the 2022/23 council tax period.

Yes, the council does refer such accounts to enforcement agents. We do not however keep separate statistics of these cases and this is exempt as Section 1.1 of the Act apply, information not held.

5. Please confirm if an assessment of vulnerability is done prior to a debt being passed to an enforcement company and if so provide a brief description of what the assessment involves. Please also confirm how many cases of people assessed as being vulnerable or potentially vulnerable were passed on to an enforcement company for the 2022/23 council tax period. 

If we are aware that a customer with an outstanding debt has a vulnerability, efforts are made by the Revenues Team to engage with the customer to assess eligibility for discounts, exemptions, reliefs, council tax support, council tax discretionary relief.  Recovery can be suspended depending on the circumstances of the case. 
If we are not aware that a customer is vulnerable, the case will be referred to enforcement agents. 
We do not however keep separate statistics of these cases in either scenario.


6. Please confirm what protocols are in place between the local authority and enforcement companies regarding the approach that should be taken when someone is assessed as being vulnerable as per the assessment referred to in Q5. Please also confirm the kinds of cases which should be raised with, or referred back to, local authorities for further consideration when encountered.

The Taking Control of Goods Regulations 2013 and associated regulations makes provision to protect vulnerable customers. 
The enforcement companies that the council has contracts with have their own Welfare Teams and where an enforcement agent becomes aware that a customer may be deemed vulnerable, they are required to alert their Welfare Team. This Team will assist where possible but are also required to notify the council.  
Each case is considered on its merits by the Revenues Team’s Debt Recovery Team with a view to helping the customer by means of assessing eligibility for discounts, exemptions, reliefs, council tax support, council tax discretionary relief, and in those cases where specialist advice is considered necessary, by referral to a Debt Advice Agency.  Enforcement agents and their Welfare Teams will also provide the customer with details of Debt Advice Agencies where they deem this is required.
Our contract with the enforcement agents also has safeguards in place to support and protect vulnerable customers.


7. Please confirm A) how many requests the council received to bring a council tax debt back from an enforcement agent due to vulnerability reasons during the 2022/23 period and B) How many times the council agreed to bring an account back due to vulnerability reasons during the 2022/23 period.

Information is not held for parts A and B as requested and the Council is advising you as required by Section 1.1 of the Act. 
However, 248 cases held by enforcement agents were closed in 2022/23 on the basis of vulnerability.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
