Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: temporary accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

Please note, the Council only holds information for the questions below.
Also, the figures are number of households in temporary accommodation as opposed to the number of people.

2. How many people in total were housed in temporary accommodation by the council in 2021?

Answer:

951

5. How many people in total were housed in temporary accommodation by the council in 2022?

980

8. How many people in total were housed in temporary accommodation by the council in 2023?

1410

11. How many people in total have been housed in temporary accommodation by the council in 2024, from January 1?

317
13. How many people are being housed in temporary accommodation by the council currently, in total?

619

Note: I am requesting an overall figure for the year specified in each question, for that calendar year, January 1 - December 31.

The Council does not record the information for the following questions.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
1. How many requests for temporary accommodation did the council receive in 2021?
3. In 2021, how many referrals to the council's environmental health team due to concerns about Category 1 hazards in temporary accommodation were made? 

4. How many requests for temporary accommodation did the council receive in 2022?

6. In 2022, how many referrals to the council's environmental health team due to concerns about Category 1 hazards in temporary accommodation were made? 

7. How many requests for temporary accommodation did the council receive in 2023?

9. In 2023, how many referrals to the council's environmental health team due to concerns about Category 1 hazards in temporary accommodation were made? 

10. How many requests for temporary accommodation has the council received so far in 2024, from January 1?
12. In 2024, how many referrals to the council's environmental health team due to concerns about Category 1 hazards in temporary accommodation have been made so far? 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
