Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: government funding for alcohol treatments services 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
	1. The total amount of funding Leicester City Council has received from central government for alcohol harm reduction and treatment services since 2011.

Answer:
This data is already in the public domain, and therefore, section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means. We have outlined where to find this information below:

Public health grant elements: 

Please see Public health grants to local authorities - Search - GOV.UK (www.gov.uk) for details. Please note that funding of the Public Health Grant is allocated as an aggregated budget, and not separately for individual programs.  

Additional drug and alcohol treatment funding allocations: 2023 to 2024 and 2024 to 2025 Additional drug and alcohol treatment funding allocations: 2023 to 2024 and 2024 to 2025 - GOV.UK
Rough Sleeping Drug and Alcohol Treatment Grant 2025 to 2026 funding allocations Rough Sleeping Drug and Alcohol Treatment Grant 2025 to 2026 funding allocations - GOV.UK
Drug strategy housing support funding: allocations 2022 to 2025 Drug strategy housing support funding: allocations 2022 to 2025 - GOV.UK
Individual Placement and Support - Individual Placement and Support - Alcohol and Drug study: main findings - GOV.UK

2. A breakdown of how this funding has been allocated, including:
*The amount spent on alcohol treatment services across the city
*The amount allocated to prevention, early intervention, and community support.
*Any funding assigned to third-party organisations or commissioned services.

Note – please note that we commission a holistic drug and alcohol treatment service and therefore cannot attribute spend on ‘individual treatment elements as requested. The figures below include our total spend on drug and alcohol treatment across all domains. 

2011-12 - exemption s1.1 of the Act apply -information not held by the Council   

2012-13 - exemption s1.1 of the Act apply -information not held by the Council   
2013-14 - £6,670,686 
2014-15 - £6,332,667
2015-16 - £6,709,233
2016-17 - £5,667,354
2017-18 - £5,553,140          
2018-19 - £6,888,488
2019-20 - £6,768,803
2020-21 - £6,283,058*

2021-22 - £6,076,514** please note that this includes additional OHID Universal Grant Funding 

2022-23 - £7,337,461 please note that this includes year 1 additional OHID supplementary funding in-line with the National Drugs Strategy
2023-24 - £7,942,232 please note that this includes year 2 additional OHID supplementary funding in-line with the National Drugs Strategy

2024-25 - £9,044,473*** – please note that this includes year 3 additional OHID supplementary funding in-line with the National Drugs Strategy 
* please note that a reduction is observed between 2019-20 and 2020-21 above; following an open tender, the successful bidding provider proposed this revised funding structure. Resultingly, this funding was subsequently re-purposed to fund other important Public Health services in response to a comprehensive commissioning review. 

** please also note that in 2021-22, one of our funding partners (NHSE England) decided to commission an element of local provision separately (prison treatment service), which is represented in the figures above. To be clear, NHSE continued to fund those elements of the service; there was not a real terms reduction in the Local Authority budget for these services during this period. 

*** for the year 2024-25, we have used our 25-26 budget  

3. How the council determines which services receive funding, including:
*The criteria used to allocate funding to different treatment providers.
*Any performance measures or assessments used to evaluate services before funding decisions are made.
*Whether the council has had discussions to consider the need to invest in culturally sensitive treatment services, given the diverse demographics of the city.
Yes

To inform our drug and alcohol needs assessment published in 2022, we worked with multi-agency partners to identify needs amongst all groups, including a range of culturally sensitive treatment services. Needs assessment available here:  Drug and alcohol needs assessment
From our needs assessment, we shaped a multi-agency Drug and Alcohol strategy and associated action plan – the implementation of our action plan is co-ordinated by a range of treatment providers and other key stakeholders locally, including but not limited to some of our key culturally sensitive treatment providers.

Identifying and addressing treatment needs of all those that require is a contractual requirement of our integrated substance use service – this includes developing strategies to reach individuals with culturally sensitive needs. Our current treatment provider sub-contracts a range of local treatment agencies that focus on diverse needs, as well as delivering a specialist diverse communities team focussing on engagement of key under-represented demographic groups; this provision includes engaging using different community languages, enhanced community outreach, and operating groups to support specific demographic groups and/or community language groups.

4. Any significant changes in funding levels or service allocations for alcohol treatment over the past three years.

Leicester City Council has maintained our investment in substance use treatment services over this period – please see response to Q1/Q2 for more details.

Leicester City Council has also been a recipient local authority of funding from the Office of Health Improvement and Disparities, in-line with the National Drug Strategy. During this period, we have received additional funding in each year – please see response to Q1/Q2 for more details.

	


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
