Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Dyslexia Assessment Policies 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Do the professionals working for your LA assess and identify dyslexia?
Answer:

Within the Learning, Communication and Interaction Team we have trained professionals who can identify and assess dyslexia.

Educational Psychologists in Leicester City recognise that for children or young people (CYP) of any given age, there will be a range of ability levels in the core skills of literacy including word reading, spelling, writing and the comprehension of written language.  However, some CYP will, despite accessing the same classroom teaching arrangements as their peers, experience considerably greater difficulties in acquiring effective skills of word reading and spelling.

Those CYP who experience such significantly greater difficulties than their peers, may be described by an EP as having the specific learning difficulty (SpLD) known as dyslexia.  When applied, EPs will be using the term ‘dyslexia’ in a way which is descriptive rather than diagnostic.

In considering the appropriateness of referring to a CYP as having dyslexia, the starting point for EPs will be that of reference to the British Psychological Society’s 1999 definition of dyslexia: “Dyslexia is evident when accurate and fluent word reading and/or spelling develops very incompletely or with great difficulty.  This focuses on literacy learning at the ‘word level’ (reading a word with no cues from any context in a sentence, no pictures etc.) and implies that the problem is severe and persistent despite appropriate learning opportunities.  It provides the basis for a staged process through teaching.”  In considering a possible dyslexic presentation, city EPs will also be mindful of other definitions such as that from the Rose Report (2009).

In responding to a request for involvement, for example from a school or parent, the approach of the EP to assessment of the CYP’s situation, will be that of taking a holistic view rather than assessing for the possibility of a particular difficulty.  This will be the case regardless of the difficulties described in the referral, which may include specific reference to dyslexic tendencies or other learning difficulties.  Through taking a holistic approach, the EP is able to consider a range of potential hypotheses as to the underlying factor or factors which may be contributing to the concerns being expressed.

In forming an initial hypothesis that the SpLD known as dyslexia is present, the EP will have explored, as consistent with a holistic approach, a range of factors potentially affecting the CYP’s literacy development including (but not limited to) the following:

· Current levels of basic literacy skills.

· Cognitive functioning including short-term memory and verbal and non-verbal reasoning.

· Significant sensory (visual and/or aural) impairments or difficulties.

· Language development.

· English as an additional language.

· School attendance.

· Concerns regarding social, emotional and behavioural (SEMH) matters.

· Specific medical factors which may be affecting development.

· Developmental delay/generalised learning difficulties.

· Early trauma and adverse life events (‘ACES’).

· Educational turbulence such as frequent changes of school.

· The views of parents and the CYP regarding the reported lack of progress.

In exploring a potential dyslexic presentation, the EP will enquire as to the interventions provided and the timescale over which they have been delivered.  In particular, the EP will be seeking evidence of high-quality intervention over a sufficient period of time, such that some significant progress would have been expected.

Lack of progress despite reported quality intervention, will be understood by the EP to be a significant indicator as to the likely presence of dyslexia.  However, it is unlikely that the EP will conclude that the description of dyslexia is appropriate on the basis of initial involvement.  It will be the expectation of the EP, that there will be a further period of support to the CYP during which, recommendations for interventions as made by the EP will have had time to make some measurable difference.  Recommendations for intervention will form part of a ‘plan, do, review’ cycle as consistent with a graduated response.

In seeking evidence of significant lack of progress despite quality intervention, the EP will assess using standardised (norm-referenced) tests (see separate table).  A measure of significant lack of age-appropriate progress, will be that of the CYP consistently remaining no higher than the 2nd percentile in word reading and spelling despite quality intervention. 

The CYP remaining no higher than the 2nd percentile in word reading and spelling, will be used by the CPS as a means of ensuring consistency across the service, with regards to what is accepted as a measure of significant lack of age-appropriate progress.  (Historically, when CYP in Leicester and Leicestershire were issued with a former ‘Statement of Special Educational Needs’ purely on the grounds of literacy difficulties, the 2nd percentile was accepted as indicative of very significant difficulties as compared to the average for their age).

In reporting their findings and conclusions, EPs will always state their reasons as to why they consider the term ‘dyslexia’ to be appropriate to an individual CYP, or not appropriate as the case may be.  Alternative hypotheses or views as to the nature of the presenting difficulties will be described as appropriate.  Whenever it is concluded that the term ‘dyslexia’ is appropriate, the EP may note that this should not be seen as limiting what the CYP might ultimately achieve.

2. Do you provide Practice Guidance or a policy for schools which sets out expectations for identifying and supporting dyslexic children?
Yes we have a protocol for schools that they need to follow before requesting a full diagnostic assessment.

3. Do you provide Practice Guidance or a policy for schools which sets out expectations for identifying and supporting children with literacy difficulties?
We provide guidance for schools that sets out how we identify pupils with literacy difficulties and recommendation to schools in how to support pupils.  We also provide training to schools.

4. What terminology do you use to describe children in your schools who experience difficulties acquiring literacy skills.
The terminology used would relate to a pupil having differences with reading, spelling, and language that relates to difficulties in comparison to their peers.

5. How do schools support children who have a confirmed diagnosis of dyslexia from an Educational Psychologist or Specialist Teacher Assessor.
Once diagnosed a pupil may undertake ‘dyslexia and me’ to enable them to explore their diagnosis.  Schools would be required to put in place the recommendations identified in the report and to make their school dyslexia friendly.

Wherever literacy development needs have been identified and regardless of whether or not the term dyslexia has been applied, EPs will make various recommendations for support and intervention as appropriate to the individual CYP and as based on the specific assessment findings.  However, it is the view of the CPS (City Psychology Service) that there are no approaches or interventions which are specific to those individuals who have been described as dyslexic.  Therefore, recommendations for support and intervention will be based entirely on the presenting difficulties.

A significant aspect of the recommendations made by EPs, will be that of support and intervention which considers the emotional well-being of the CYP.  Therefore, rather than placing focus purely on what might be considered literacy-based approaches to intervention, recommendations made by the EP will also include suggestions for maintaining the CYP’s self-confidence, self-esteem and motivation, minimising anxiety and making learning a rewarding and enjoyable experience.

6. How many children in your local authority experience difficulties acquiring literacy skills?

7. How many children in your local authority have a diagnosis of dyslexia?
In respect of Qs. 6 and 7, our reporting does not capture this data. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
10.
How many children in your area have:

a) an Education, Health and Care Plan (EHCP)
active plans today 3845

For the below questions we can only provide data on the following categories

Cognition and Learning

Moderate Learning

Specific Learning

General Learning 

Based on this the numbers are below 

8. Can you provide data on how many children access SEN support for difficulties with literacy skills in a) primary and b) secondary school.
a) primary 112 and b) 195 secondary school. 

9. Can you provide data on how many children access SEN support for dyslexia in a) primary and b) secondary school.
This is information not held.  The reporting does not capture this data. 
b) dyslexia specified as a Special Educational Need in Section B of the EHCP
c) 
a Dyslexia Specialist School named in Section I of their EHCP?

The LA don’t hold the information for b & c. Exemption section 1.1 of the Act -information not held apply.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
