FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Is training provided to social workers to identify children who have been psychologically manipulated to reject a parent (parental alienation)? If such training is given, please provide an electronic copy of the training manual.

There is no specific training offered that targets ‘children who have been psychologically manipulated to reject a parent (parental alienation)’.


2. In 2023, how many concerns over child abuse / neglect (separate cases) were reported to Leicester City Council?
2181.  This is children who have Primary Need Code N1 (Abuse or Neglect) and a referral in 2023.  
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold separate figures for the above. Staff would need to trawl through all case files to establish the initial concern raised.  Allowing 5 minutes to locate and check each file will exceed the appropriate limit.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

3. Are concerns over child abuse / neglect dealt with by Leicester City Council if reported anonymously?
Yes, dependent on the nature of the allegation and whether the child was identifiable from the information provided. 

4. For 2023, please provide a breakdown of who reported the concerns over child abuse/ neglect to Leicester City Council (eg school, police, a parent etc)
Anonymous: 20
Education Services: 112
Health services: 335
Individual: 104
LA services: 361
Legal Agency (Court/Prob/Immig/Prison/CAFCASS): 67
Not known: 101
Other (Children centre/Ind Age/Vol Org,egNSPCC): 106
Police: 692
Schools: 283

Again, this is children who have Primary Need Code N1 (Abuse or Neglect), we cannot separate the case types.

5. For 2023, please provide a breakdown of what the concerns were that were reported to Leicester City Council (eg physical abuse, sexual abuse, neglect, emotional abuse etc)
The following are the number of cases that have progressed to an assessment:

AN - Neglect: 269
AN - Emotional: 329
AN - Physical Abuse (Child to Child): 79
AN - Physical Abuse (Adult to Child): 228
AN - Sexual Abuse (Child to Child): 61
AN - Sexual Abuse (Adult to Child): 87

6. Of ALL the separate cases of child abuse / neglect reported to Leicester City Council in 2023, how many cases subsequently went to the Family Court? 
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

Again, this is not held in a reportable format and staff would need to trawl through all records to establish those cases that progressed to Family Court.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.


7. Between 15th and 31st JANUARY 2023 ONLY, please provide a breakdown of who the allegations of child abuse / neglect were made AGAINST that were reported to Leicester City Council (eg a teacher, a parent of the child etc)

8. Of ALL the cases of child abuse / neglect reported to Leicester City Council between 15th and 31st JANUARY 2023 ONLY, in how many of these cases did the assigned social worker recommend that the child(ren) in question be removed (or remain separated) from ONE parent ONLY at the start of a section 47 investigation?

9. Of ALL the cases of child abuse / neglect reported to Leicester City Council between 15th and 31st JANUARY 2023 ONLY, in how many of these cases did the assigned social worker recommend that the child(ren) in question be removed (or remain separated) from ONE parent ONLY after the section 47 investigation had been completed?

10. Of ALL the cases reported to Leicester City Council of child abuse / neglect between 15th and 31st JANUARY 2023 ONLY, how many cases subsequently went to the Family Court? 

11. Of ALL the cases of child abuse / neglect that were reported to Leicester City Council between 15th and 31st JANUARY 2023 ONLY AND that subsequently went to the Family Court, in how many of these cases were the central allegations of child abuse / neglect against the accused parent (as accused in the report to Leicester City Council) found to be false by the court?

In response to questions 7 - 11
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information in a reportable format. There were 111 referrals in the time frame requested. Staff would be required to locate and trawl through each casefile to gather the specific data requested.  Allowing 20 – 30 minutes to trawl and collate the data would require over 37 hours of officer time. 
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
