FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act I would like to request the following information:
1. The number of empty properties of which you are aware in your local authority area.
Total Empty over 1 day as at 31/03/2023 4900
This information includes any property empty as reported by Council Tax records out of a City of 145,000 homes. Many of these homes return in to use quickly.

The Council have a dedicated Empty Homes team that work to ensure properties are brought back in to use. The Empty Homes Team brough 197 properties back in to use in 22/23 using their incremental approach 

2. The length of time the properties have been empty by reference to periods of over 6 months, one year, five years and ten years
The Council holds data on the total number of properties empty over each of the time periods stated in the table but for the reasons set out below cannot provide individual data in relation to the length of time the properties have been empty.
	Length Empty
	Number

	Number of homes empty for longer than 18 months
	394

	Number of Homes empty for longer than 5 years
	46

	Number of Homes Empty for longer than 10 years
	12


3. The number of empty properties in your local authority area where you are aware that they are empty as a consequence of the last occupier passing away.

4. The length of time that the properties described in Para 3 above have been empty by reference to periods of over 6 months, one year, five years and ten years

5. The number of notices served under Section 103 of the Law of Property Act 1925 or where any legal action has been taken under the Empty Homes legislation with refence to the periods of the last 6 months, last 12 months, five years and ten years

6. The number of properties sold following the councils enforced sale procedure for empty properties for the last 6 months, last 12 months, five years and ten years.
The Council has completed the Compulsory purchase order (CPO) process 13 times in the last 12 years which has then led to the sale of these properties.
7. The number of properties sold in the last 10 years by your local authority where you have been unable to trace a next of loin or beneficiary or other person with a legal entitlement to the proceeds of sale.

In response to questions 2. 3. 4. 5. and 7.

 

This information is either not held by Leicester City Council or it is not feasible to collate the data requested within the 18 hour limit prescribed by the Act. Therefore, the following exemptions are applicable:

Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council and;  
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format.  Information regarding a property and the ownership, death, next of kin etc. would be recorded against that address, not in a reportable format for the purpose of this request.

Staff would have to locate and trawl through each case file to establish if the information was held and then compile the data.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
